Regn.No. KERBIL/2012/45073
ated 05-09-2012 with RNI

Reg No.KL/TV (N)/634/2021-2023

©
CHOE MBBOHID
Government of Kerala
2024

CHOG NIV

KERALA GAZETTE

G VoWImeMo
EXTRAORDINARY

GRW1SI018H00®] (nIM1RVe]S)EmMOY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

®1) UMD L) @0, 2024 &)6nd 07
oauas) 07th June 2024
(\‘;'3:1'38(7 |1|3 22 1199 @nsulo 24 “’“,\’f? 1829

o Thiruvananthapuram, 24th |davam 1199
Friday 1946 683 af00 17

17th Jyashta 1946

GOVERNMENT OF KERALA
Law (Legislation-H) Department
NOTIFICATION

Dated, Thiruvananthapuram, 7th June, 2024
24th Idavam, 1199
17th Jyaishta, 1946.

No. 142/Leg.H2/2022/Law.

The following Act of the Kerala State Legislature is hereby published for general

information. The Bill as passed by the Legislative Assembly received the assent of the

Governor on the 26th day of April, 2024.

By order of the Governor,

K. G. SANAL KUMAR,
Law Secretary.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/



ACT 9 OF 2024
THE KERALA CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETIES (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2023

An Act further to amend the Kerala Co-operative Societies Act, 1969.

Preamble—WHEREAS, it is expedient further to amend the Kerala Co-operative Societies

Act, 1969 (Act 21 of 1969) for the purposes hereinafter appearing;
BE it enacted in the Seventy-fourth Year of the Republic of India as follows:—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Act may be called the Kerala Co-operative

Societies ( Amendment) Act, 2023.
(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 2.— In section 2 of the Kerala Co-operative Societies Act, 1969

(Act 21 of 1969) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act),—
(1) in clause (ab), the following sentence shall be added at the end, namely:—

“It includes the verification of accounts through software solutions, auditing of
information system and migration of data, in the case of societies whose accounts are

computerized”
(i1) after clause (ac), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(ad) “administrative audit” means a close assessment of all affairs of the society,
including constitution, management and establishment, maintenance of books and accounts and
other records and internal control systems of the society and the extent to which its activities
were useful in promoting the economic welfare of the members in accordance with the co-
operative principles, and it includes Compliance Audit, Performance Audit as well as IT

Audit;”.
(111) after clause (da), the following clauses shall be inserted, namely:—

“(db) “common software for Primary Agricultural Credit Societies” means an
effective software solution that covers the complete day-to-day functions of Primary

Agricultural Credit Societies through a centralised architecture.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




(dc) “consortium” means a formal association of co-operative societies formed
based on a common objective for establishing a new entity for raising funds for providing

financial assistance for public purpose with the approval of State Government;”.
(iv) for clause (ib), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—

“(ib) “Federal Co-operative Society” means a society having more than one
district as its area of operation and having the State Government, individuals and other co-
operative societies as its members. But the number of individual members in the society shall

not exceed twenty five per cent of the total membership in the society:

Provided that the condition regarding number of individual members shall not be
applicable to societies which are in existence before the commencement of the Kerala Co-

operative Societies (Amendment) Act, 2023;”.
(v) for clause (oaa), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—

“(oaa) “Primary Agricultural Credit Society” means a service co-operative
society, a service co-operative bank, a farmers' service co-operative bank or a rural bank having
its area of operation confined to a Village, Panchayat or Municipality and the primary object
or principal business of which is to provide financial accommodation to its members for
agricultural purposes or allied agricultural activities, the rate of interest on such loans and

advances and the area of operation shall be fixed by the Registrar:

Provided that the restriction regarding area of operation shall not apply to societies or

banks which are in existence on 1% January, 2000.”.
(vi) for clause (ob), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—

“(ob) “Primary Credit Society” means a co-operative society other than Primary
Agricultural Credit Society, the primary object or principal business of which is to accept
deposit from its members for the purpose of lending to its members or investments and the

bye-laws of which do not permit admission of any other co-operative society as its member;”.

(vii) for clause (od), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




“(od) “Primary Co-operative Society” means a society having jurisdiction over
any specified area in one revenue district or more than one districts in the State and having

individuals, other societies, State Government and Local Self Government as its members;”.

(viii) in clause (p), for the words “any person”, the words “any other officer of the

State Government” shall be substituted.
(ix) after clause (gb), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(gba) “Social Co-operative Societies” means primary co-operative societies
formed for the welfare of social classes like differently abled persons, aged persons,

transgenders, depressed persons or mentally challenged persons;”.

(x) in clause (ra), before the words “State Co-operative Agricultural Rural

Development Bank”, the word “Kerala” shall be inserted.
(x1) after clause (u), the following clause shall be added, namely:—

“(v) “Youth Co-operative Societies” means co-operative societies which are
registered to promote entrepreneurship, new technology, innovations and start-ups with the
objective to generate employment and income and the welfare of youth and having its area of

operation within one district.”.
3. Amendment of section 3.—In section 3 of the principal Act,—

(1) in sub-section (1), for the words “a person”, the words “an officer of the State

Government” shall be substituted.

(1) in sub-section (2), for the words “any person”, the words “any officer of the State

Government” shall be substituted.
4. Amendment of section 7— In section 7 of the principal Act,—
(1) in sub-section (1),—

(a) in clause (d), the word “and”, coming after the word and symbol “rules;” shall

be deleted.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




(b) in clause (e) for the words and symbols “, he may register the society and its
bye-laws within a period of ninety days from the date of receipt of the application.”, the symbol

and word ““; and” shall be substituted.
(c) after clause (e), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(f) that the proposed credit societies have collected two lakhs and fifty
thousand rupees and non-credit co-operative societies have collected one lakh rupees as the

minimum share capital;

he may register the society and its bye-laws within a period of sixty days from the date of

receipt of the application:

Provided that the requirement of minimum share capital in this clause shall not be
applicable to co-operative societies of Scheduled Castes/ Scheduled Tribes, Fisheries, Vanitha,
Transgenders, Primary Anand Pattern Milk Co-operative Societies, Schools, Colleges and

Traditional Industrial co-operative societies.”.

(i1) in sub-section (2), for the words “seven days”, the words “fifteen days” shall be

substituted.

(i11) in sub-section (3), for the words “ninety days”, the words “sixty days” shall be

substituted.

5. Amendment of section 84.—In sub-section (2) of section 8A of the principal Act, for

the words “sixty days” wherever it occurs, the words “forty five days” shall be substituted.
6. Amendment of section 14.— In section 14 of the principal Act,—

(1) in marginal heading of section 14, after the word “Amalgamation”, the word and

symbol “merger,” shall be inserted.
(1) in sub-section (1),—

(a) after the words and symbol “A society may,”, the words and symbol “with the

prior approval of the Registrar,” shall be inserted;

(b) for the words “two third”, the word “simple” shall be substituted.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




(ii1) in sub-section (2) , after the words and symbol “‘societies may,”, the words and
symbol “with the prior approval of the Registrar,” shall be inserted and for the words “two

third”, the word “simple” shall be substituted.
(iv) after sub-section (2), the following shall be added as sub-section (2A),—

“(2A) Notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained in any other law in
force or in the rules or in the bye-laws of any society, one or more societies may merge with
any other society by a resolution passed by simple majority at the general body meeting of each

such society:

Provided that before effecting such merger a resolution of the society with whom it has
to merge shall give its approval permitting such merger by a resolution passed by simple

majority of the general body meeting of such society.”.

(v) in sub-section (3) , for the words, figure and symbol ““ or sub-section (2)”, the
symbol, words and figure *, sub-section (2) or sub-section (2A)” and for the words and symbol
“transfer, division or amalgamation”, the words and symbol “amalgamation, merger, transfer

or division” shall be substituted.
(vi) after sub-section (7), the following sub-section shall be added, namely:—

“(8) Detailed scheme of transfer of assets and liabilities and the scheme of
merger, as the case may be, prepared by the society and approved by the Registrar as per sub-
section (1), sub-section (2) or sub-section (2A) shall be published by the Registrar and the
Society.”.

7. Amendment of section 144A.— In section 14AA of the principal Act,—
(1) after sub-section (2), the following sub-sections shall be added, namely:—

“(2A) The share capital contribution or financial assistance to the subsidiary
institution shall be met from the balance net profit of the society, as provided under sub-section
(2) of section 56 and any further investment in subsidiary institutions from the society/bank
other than share capital shall be released as loan as per the norms as may be specified by the

Registrar.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




(2B) Any society/bank which had availed any financial assistance from
Government, shall include nominees of Government of Kerala in the board of directors of the

subsidiary institutions, as may be prescribed.

(2C) The Registrar shall conduct audit, inspection and verification of records in

the subsidiary institutions, as may be prescribed.

(2D) Any share capital contribution or financial assistance to the subsidiary
institutions from the society/bank shall be allotted with the prior approval of the Registrar based

on the resolution passed by the general body of the society/bank concerned.

(2E) Transferring funds or leasing of assets of the society to its subsidiary
institutions shall be made with the prior approval of the Government based on the resolution

passed by the general body of the society/bank.”.

(i1) after the existing sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be added,

namely:—

“(4) Notwithstanding anything contained in the foregoing provisions of this
section, no subsidiary institution shall be promoted under this section on or after the
commencement of the Kerala Co-operative Societies (Amendment) Act, 2023 and the existing
subsidiary institutions registered and working immediately before the commencement of the
Kerala Co-operative Societies (Amendment) Act, 2023 shall continue its operation subject to

the foregoing provisions in sub-sections (1) to (3) and in the manner as may be prescribed.”.
8. Amendment of section 14B.—In section 14B of the principal Act,—

(1) after the existing sub-section (1), the following sub-sections shall be inserted,

namely:—

“(1A) Detailed project report for the formation of such partnership of co-operative
societies shall be prepared by the societies concerned and the same shall be submitted to the

general bodies of such societies for approval.

(1B) The project report approved by the general bodies of the societies shall be
submitted to the Government through the Registrar for the approval of the formation of such

partnership of co-operative societies, in the manner as may be prescribed.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




(1C) The Registrar shall conduct audit, inspection and verification of records in

such societies, in the manner as may be prescribed.

(1D) In the case of raising of fund for such partnership prior sanction of the
Government shall be obtained by the partnership of co-operative societies, in the manner as

may be prescribed.”.

9. Amendment of section 15.—After sub-section (3) of section 15 of the principal Act, the

following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—

“(4) Where one or more societies are merged with another society in accordance with
the provisions of section 14, the registration of each of the merging society shall stand cancelled

and shall be deemed to have been dissolved and shall cease to exist as a corporate body.”.

10. Amendment of section 16.—In section 16 of the principal Act, after the existing
proviso to item (i) of clause (a) of sub-section (1), the following item and proviso shall be

added, namely:—

“(ia) in the case of Youth Co-operative Societies, who has not attained the age of

forty-five years:

Provided that on attaining forty-five years, the membership of such members shall cease

to exist and they shall become associate members of the society.”.

11. Amendment of section 18.—In section 18 of the principal Act, sub-section (3) shall

be substituted as follows,—

“(3) Save as provided in this section, a nominal or associate member shall have such
privileges and rights of a member and be eligible to enjoy various services including credit
facilities provided by the societies and be subject to such liabilities of a member, as may be

specified in the bye-laws of the society.”.
12. Amendment of section 19.—In section 19 of the principal Act,—
(1) the existing section shall be numbered as sub-section (1);

(i1) after sub-section (1) so numbered, the following sub-section shall be inserted,

namely:—

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




“(2) If the general body of a society has decided to enhance the share value, the
right of a member to continue in membership will remain for a period of five years from the
date of enhancement of value of share but shall be allowed to exercise his rights as a member

only upon remitting the enhanced value of the shares held.”.
13. Amendment of section 19B.—In section 19B of the principal Act,—
(1) in clause (e), the word “and” shall be omitted;
(i1) in clause (f), for the symbol “.”, the symbol and word *“; and” shall be substituted;
(ii1) after clause (f), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(g) summary of defects included in the latest statutory audit report along with
the rectification report approved by the Committee and general body of the society.”.

14. Amendment of section 20.—In section 20 of the principal Act, in clause (d), after the

word “election” the words “and removal” shall be inserted.

15. Amendment of section 22.—In sub-section (1) of section 22 of the principal Act, after

the existing proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided further that the maximum amount of share capital that an individual
member can hold in an Urban Co-operative Bank having Reserve Bank of India licence is

limited to five per cent of the value of total paid-up share capital of the bank.”.

16. Amendment of section 26.—In section 26 of the principal Act, in clause (b) of

sub-section (1), for the word “two”, the word “three” shall be substituted.
17. Amendment of section 28.—In section 28 of the principal Act,—
(1) in the third proviso to sub-section (1),—

(a) for the words “the committees of the”, the words “the committees of all

Primary Agricultural Credit Societies and all primary” shall be inserted;
(b)for the words “any society”, the words “such society” shall be substituted.

(i1) provisos to sub-section (1A) shall be omitted.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




10

(ii1) in sub-section (1C), for the words “ten thousand rupees”, the words “twenty-

five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.
(iv) after sub-section (1C), the following sub-section shall be added,—

“(1CA) Notwithstanding anything contained in the Act, rules or the bye-laws of
the society, two seats in the Committee of each society shall be reserved for members who shall
not exceed the age of forty years on the date of filing of nomination for election, of whom one
shall be from the non-reserved category and one shall be a woman from the reservation

category provided in sub-section (1) of section 28A.”.

(v) for item (iii) of sub-section (1E), the following item shall be substituted,

namely:—

“(ii1) such bifurcation shall be completed within a period of one year from the

date of issue of bifurcation order by the Registrar.”.
(vi) for sub-section (1G), the following shall be substituted, namely:—

“(1G) Notwithstanding anything contained in the bye-laws of a society, the
Committee in office shall co-opt two persons or representatives who are/were in paid service
of a Commercial Bank, Kerala State Co-operative Bank, an Urban Co-operative Bank, Kerala
State Agriculture and Rural Development Bank, a Primary Co-operative Agricultural and
Rural Development Bank, erstwhile District Co-operative Banks or a Service Co-operative
Bank in the Managerial Cadre or Specialization in Co-operation/ Co-operative Management,
Management, Agriculture, Economics, Commerce, Public Finance, Law, Rural Development

and Information Technology as members of the Committee of such society:

Provided that the number of such co-opted members shall not exceed two in addition to

the maximum limit specified in sub-section (1A):

Provided further that such co-opted members shall not have the right to vote in any
election of the co-operative society in their capacity as such member and is not eligible to be

elected as office bearers of the board:

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




11

Provided also that such co-opted members of a co-operative society shall also be
members of the board and such members shall be excluded for the purpose of counting the total

number of directors specified in sub-section (1A):

Provided also that if the Committee does not co-opt the persons as specified within a
period of six months from the date on which the Committee is constituted, the Government or
the Registrar, as the case may be, with due notice as may be prescribed shall make such

nominations as specified in the sub-section.”.
(vii) after sub-section (2), the following shall be added as sub-section (2A),—

“(2A) Notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained in the Act, rules or in
the bye-laws of a credit society, no member of the Committee of a society shall be eligible for
election to the Committee for more than three consecutive terms, irrespective of whether the

term is in full or in part.

Explanation.—For the purpose of this sub-section, “credit society” means the Kerala
State Co-operative Bank Limited, Primary Agricultural Credit Societies, Service Co-operative
Banks, Regional Co-operative Banks, Rural Banks, Farmer's Service Co-operative Banks,
Urban Co-operative Banks, The Kerala State Co-operative Agricultural and Rural
Development Bank Limited, Primary Co-operative Agricultural and Rural Development Bank,
Urban Co-operative Societies, Agricultural Improvement Co-operative Societies, Employees
Credit Societies, Rural Co-operative Societies, Primary Housing Co-operative Societies and

Kerala State Housing Federation.”.

(viii) in the proviso to sub-section (3), the words “or more than two societies of

different types” shall be added at the end.

18. Amendment of section 284B.—In section 28 AB of the principal Act, in sub-section
(2), after the words “or any other officer of the committee”, the words “or a delegate of the

society who has been appointed by the committee” shall be inserted.
19. Amendment of section 28B.—In section 28B of the principal Act,—

(1) In sub-section(1), after the word “societies”, the symbols and words “, the state

co-operative union and the circle co-operative unions” shall be inserted.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




12

(i1)) In sub-section (2) of section 28B, for the words “Special Secretary to
Government” the words and symbol “Special Secretary to Government, Law Department” shall

be substituted.
20. Amendment of section 29.—In section 29 of the principal Act,—
(i) in sub-section (1),—

(a) in clause (cc), for the word “accounts”, the words “audited accounts” shall be

substituted;
(b) for clause (ce), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—

“(ce) consideration of detailed list of all liabilities of members of the
Committee and the employees of the society, and their family members, due to the society for

the previous financial year.

Explanation.— For the purpose of this clause, “family members” means husband, wife,

their children including adopted children and parents ; and”.
(i1) sub-section (2) shall be substituted as follows, namely:—

“(2) The Registrar or any person deputed by him and the Director of Co-operative
Audit or any person deputed by him may have the right to attend in the committee and in the

general body meeting of any society.”.

21. Amendment of section 31.—In sub-section (3) of section 31 of the principal Act, after
the words “take part”, the words “in the voting for the election of office bearers and” shall be

inserted.
22. Amendment of section 32— In section 32 of the principal Act,—
(1) in sub-section (1),—
(a) after clause (b) the following clause shall be added as clause (ba), namely:—

“(ba) willful disobedience of execution of orders etc., referred to in section

76 of the Act ; or ”;

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




13

(b) in clause (d), for the words “who need not be members of the society”, the
words “who shall be from among the members of the society” shall be substituted and the third

proviso and Explanation I shall be omitted and in Explanation II the number “II” shall be

deleted;

(c) in clause (e), for the words “two consecutive terms”, the words “next one

term” shall be substituted.
(i1) in sub-section (4), the following words shall be added at the end, namely:—

“including enrollment of members, provided such members shall not have voting

rights unless an elected committee ratifies the membership.”.
23. Amendment of section 33.—In section 33 of the principal Act,—

(1) in sub-section (1), in clause (b), for the words “who need not be members of the

society”, the words “who shall be from among the members of the society” shall be substituted.
(i1) in sub-section (2),—

(a) after the words ““any officer of the society”, the words “including enrollment

of members” shall be inserted;
(b) the following sentence shall be inserted at the end, namely:—

“The members so enrolled shall not have voting right unless an elected
Committee ratifies such membership and if the Committee does not ratify any such

membership, shall specify the reasons thereof for such denial.”.

24. Insertion of new section 344.—In the principal Act, after section 34, the following

section shall be inserted, namely:—

“34A. Maintenance of accounts and adoption of common software.—(1) All
co-operative societies shall prepare and keep the books of accounts and financial statements in
the form in the generally accepted accounting principle for preparing profit and loss account

and balance sheet, which enable double entry book keeping system, as may be prescribed.

(2) The Registrar shall issue necessary guidelines for installation, maintenance

and use of common software to all co-operative societies, as may be prescribed.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




14

(3) A technical cell with professional and technical team as prescribed shall be
established in the office of the Registrar, in consultation with the Government, to inspect the

security, reliability, data protection and other aspects connected with software and hardware.”.

25. Amendment of section 364.— In section 36A of the principal Act, for the figures,
words and symbol “10 to 15 (both inclusive)”, the figures, words and symbol “9 to 15 (both
inclusive) and 19 to 28 (both inclusive)” shall be substituted.

26. Amendment of section 56.— In section 56 of the principal Act,—

(1) in sub-section (1), after clause (c), the following clause shall be inserted,

namely:—

“(d) credit five percent of net profit to the Professional Education Fund

maintained by the Registrar.”.
(i1) in sub-section (2), clause (cc) shall be deleted.

27. Amendment of section 564.—In section 56A of the principal Act, the following

proviso shall be added, namely:—

“Provided that, if the immovable property is to be utilized for activities connected
with the objectives of the society, it shall seek the prior approval from the Registrar based on

the resolution of the general body of the society.”.

28. Amendment of section 57C.—In section 57C of the principal Act, in sub-section

(1), after the words “providing loans for”, the words “public purposes and for” shall be inserted.

29. Insertion of new section 57E.—In the principal Act, after section 57D, the following

section shall be inserted, namely:—

“57E. Co-operative Revival Fund Scheme—(1) The Government may, by
notification in the Gazette, frame a scheme to be called “the Co-operative Revival Fund
Scheme” for establishing a fund for the purpose of reviving societies which are weaker or
remain in dormant position due to certain extraordinary situation by providing financial
assistance subject to such terms and conditions to be specified in the scheme and shall be

administered in such manner as may be prescribed.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




15

(2) There shall be earmarked to the fund,—

(a) an amount which is not more than fifty percent of the reserve fund,

referred to in clause (a) of sub-section (1) of section 56; and

(b) not more than fifty per cent of the Agriculture Credit Stabilization Fund

set apart by Agricultural Credit Societies from their net profit; as and when required;
(¢) such fund that may be granted by Government from time to time; and

(d) any other amount which under the provisions of the scheme may be

credited to the fund.”.

30. Amendment of section 59.—In section 59 of the principal Act, after the existing sub-

section (2), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—

“(2A) A society shall not sanction loans or advances exceeding the individual
maximum borrowing power fixed by the Registrar and as provided in the bye-laws of the
society. For any contravention of this provision, the Chief Executive and the Committee of the
co-operative society concerned shall be liable for punishment, provided in sub-section (7A) of

section 94 of the Act.”.

31. Insertion of new sections 594 and 59B.—In the principal Act, after section 59, the

following sections shall be inserted, namely:—

“S9A. Valuation of property.—The valuation of immovable property to be pledged
as security to a co-operative society shall be valued by an officer/officers authorised by the
Committee in cases where the loan amount is below ten lakhs and where the loan amount
exceeds ten lakhs, by a panel of five members consisting of two officers including the Chief
Executive Officer of the society and two members of the Committee and an independent valuer

authorised by the Committee.

59B. Purchase of movable and immovable properties by the societies.— Societies
shall follow the norms, as may be prescribed, while acquiring movable and immovable

properties by utilizing the own fund of the society.”.

32. Amendment of section 63.—In section 63 of the principal Act,—

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




16

(1) in sub-section (4), after the first proviso, the following proviso shall be added,

namely:—

“Provided further that in the case of those societies which are liable to file income
tax returns, financial statements for that purpose shall be duly certified by the Auditor, within

three months from the end of the financial year.”.

(i1) for sub-section (9) and the proviso thereto, the following sub-section shall be

substituted, namely:—

“(9) Every co-operative society shall cause to be audited by a team of auditors
appointed by the Director of Co-operative Audit in accordance with the scheme approved and
notified by the State Government. The composition, structure of the team, mode of conducting
audit, mode of processing and preparing audit report shall be included in the scheme approved

by the State Government.”.
(ii1) sub-section (10) shall be substituted as follows, namely:—

“(10) The financial accounts of all apex societies and all urban co-operative banks
shall be audited by auditing firms, from among the panel approved by the Director of
Co-operative Audit and the administrative matters and related accounts of assisted apex
societies shall be audited by the departmental auditors and submit the audit reports to the
Director of Co-operative Audit. If the audit discloses any misappropriation or fraud or
defalcation of money or property or assets of the society, audit team shall prepare a special
report and forward the same to the Director of Co-operative Audit and the Registrar. The
Registrar himself, or the Director of Co-operative Audit in consultation with the Registrar, shall

forward the special report to the Vigilance Officer appointed under section 68A for detailed
inquiry.”.

(1v) in sub-section (12), for the words “who need not be”, the words “who shall be

from among the” shall be substituted.
(v) after sub-section (12), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—

“(12A) No auditor or auditing firms or team of auditors shall be entrusted with

the audit of a co-operative society for more than two consecutive audits.”.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




17

33. Amendment of section 64.—In section 64 of the principal Act,—
(1) after sub-section (1), the following sub-sections shall be added, namely:—

“(1A) In the case of co-operative societies whose accounts are prepared using a
common software or any other software approved by the Registrar, the audit includes the audit

of information system and evaluation of software as well as hardware.

(1B) If during the audit of information system and evaluation of software and
hardware, any manipulation of records or manipulation in the working of the software or
hardware is revealed, the auditor/auditors/audit firms shall inform the manipulations to the

Director of Co-operative Audit and the Registrar.

(1C) The Registrar himself, or the Director of Co-operative Audit in consultation
with the Registrar shall inform the manipulations in the system to the Police or Vigilance

officer, as the case may be, for investigation.”.

(i1) in sub-section (4A), for the words “one month”, the words “fifteen days” shall
be substituted and for the words “who need not be”, the words “who shall be from among the”

shall be substituted.

(111) in sub-section (4B), for the words “three months”, the words “forty five days”

shall be substituted.
(iv) in sub-section (5),—

(a) after the words “The auditor”, the words “or team of auditors” shall be

inserted;
(b) for the words “four months”, the words “ninety days” shall be substituted.
(v) after sub-section (5), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—

“(5A) On completion of audit and before submission of audit report to the
Director of Co-operative Audit, the auditor or audit team or audit firm, as the case may be, shall
discuss the audit findings with the Managing Committee of the society concerned and get their

reply in writing.”.

(vi) sub-section (9) shall be substituted as follows, namely:—

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




18

“(9) If the result of the audit held under this section discloses any defect in the
working of the society, the Committee shall take steps to rectify the defects and irregularities
pointed out in the audit report, if any, and place the audit report along with the action taken
report before the general body meeting to be held every year and explain therein the said defects
or the irregularities. The Committee shall continue to take steps for rectification of all the
defects and the irregularities in the audit report and appraise the general body meetings every
year till all the defects and the irregularities are rectified. The Committee shall send a report
of action taken to the Director of Co-operative Audit and to the Registrar within fifteen days

from the date of the general body meeting.”.
(vii) after sub-section (9), the following sub-section shall be added, namely:—

“(9A) If the Director of Co-operative Audit or the person authorized by him to
carry out the audit of a society is of the opinion that any person had attempted to destroy or to
tamper with the records or documents so as to evade legal action on the mischief committed in
the society, he shall report the matter to his controlling officer for filing a complaint to the
Police or the Vigilance Officer in consultation with the Registrar or the person authorized by

him, as the case may be.”.
34. Amendment of section 65.—In section 65 of the principal Act,—
(1) in sub-section (1),—
(a) clause (b) shall be omitted;
(b) for clause (d), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—

“(d) on an application by the majority of the members of the committee of the
society or by not less than one third of the total members of the society or the number of

members required for quorum for the General Body meeting, whichever is less; or”;

(c) in clause (f), after the words “by a person”, the words “or persons” shall be

added.

(i1) in sub-section (2), after clause (c), the following clause shall be added, namely:—

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




19

“(d) The person/persons related to or involved in the inquiry shall be issued a
notice, indicating the matter of inquiry and he/they shall be provided an opportunity of being

heard, with proper notice by registered post or in person.”.
(ii1) after sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—

“(2A) When an inquiry made under this section reveals any defect, the Registrar
or the person or the persons authorized by him to conduct the inquiry, shall prepare a detailed
inquiry report regarding the defects, amount of misappropriation and other losses to the society,
with quantification of individual liability. If the inquiry reveals any offence under section 94,
the enquiry officer shall prepare a special report and submit it to the Registrar and he shall
forward a copy simultaneously to the Police or the Vigilance officer, as the case may be, for

further detailed investigation.”.

(iv) in sub-section (5), for the words “six months”, the words “four months” shall be

substituted.

(v) in sub-section (6), for the words and figure “provisions of section 32”, the words
and symbol “he may initiate action in accordance with the provisions of this Act.” shall be

substituted.
(vi) after sub-section (6), the following sub-section shall be added, namely:—

“(7) If any inquiry reveals that any irregularity, misappropriation or fraud or
defalcation of money or property or assets of the co-operative society is committed or that any
loss is incurred to the society, the Registrar or any officer specifically empowered or authorised
by the Registrar in this behalf shall take immediate necessary steps to recover the
misappropriated or defalcated money or property or assets of the society through legal actions

after assessing the loss.”.
35. Amendment of section 66.—In section 66 of the principal Act,—
(1) after sub-section (2), the following sub-sections shall be inserted, namely:—

“(2A) The Registrar may authorize special team of officers under his control for
the inspection of apex, central and federal co-operative societies and all other primary

co-operative societies.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




20

(2B) The report of such inspections shall be communicated in writing to the apex,
central and federal societies and all primary co-operative societies concerned, within a period
of thirty days and the Committee and the chief executive of the society concerned shall be
under an obligation to file a para-wise satisfactory compliance report before the Registrar

within a period of forty five days from the date of such communication.”.
(i1) sub-section (6) and the proviso thereto shall be deleted.
36. Amendment of section 66C.—In section 66C of the principal Act, —
(1) the existing section shall be numbered as sub-section (1).
(i1) the clause (f) in sub-section (1) so numbered, shall be re-lettered as clause (g).
(ii1) before clause (g) so re-lettered, the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(f) rectification reports approved by the Committee on audit report and the

resolution of the General Body of the society.”.

(iv) after sub-section (1), the following shall be inserted as sub-section (2),

namely:—

“(2) Every co-operative society shall submit quarterly returns on the credit
activities, duly certified by the chief executive of the co-operative society, which will be duly
reviewed by the Registrar and the rectification report shall be submitted on the basis of the
report evaluated by the Registrar after each quarter. If any society fails to submit the returns on
time, the Registrar shall have the power to impose fine not exceeding Ten Thousand Rupees

based on the classification and category of the Society as may be prescribed.”.
37. Amendment of section 68.—In section 68 of the principal Act,—

(1) in sub-section (1), after the words “winding up of the society”, the words “or on

the basis of the report of the Vigilance Officer” shall be inserted.
(1) in sub-section (3),—

(a) after the figure and symbols “(2),”, the words “within a period of sixty days”
shall be inserted;

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




21

(b) the following proviso shall be added, namely:—

“Provided that such period may, at the discretion of the Registrar and for
reason to be recorded in writing, be extended from time to time, however that the extended

period shall not exceed sixty days.”.

38. Insertion of new section 68B.—After section 68A, the following may be added as

section 68B, namely:—

“68B. Power of Government or Registrar to deal with irregularities etc.—(1) The
Government or the Registrar, as the case may be, may forward the cases of misappropriation
or irregularities or corruption in the society which comes under the provisions of the Indian
Penal Code, 1860 or/and of the Prevention of Corruption Act, 1988, to the Police or Vigilance

and Anti-Corruption Bureau, as the case may be, for investigation and further action.

(2) The Registrar shall be the authority to accord sanction for inquiry/enquiry or
investigation and also for taking cognizance of an offence under the Prevention of Corruption

Act, 1988 against the members of the Committee and/or officers and servants of the society.

(3) In the case of Chief Executive Officers appointed by the Government, the

Secretary to Government, Co-operation Department shall be the sanctioning authority.”.
39. Amendment of section 69.—In section 69 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1),—
(1) for clause (h), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—
“(h) between the society and a creditor of the society; or”.

(i1) after clause (h), the following clauses shall be added as clause (i) and (j),

namely:—
“(i) between the co-operative society and its subsidiaries under section 14AA; or

(j) between the members of the partnership formed under section 14B, such
dispute shall be referred to the Co-operative Arbitration Court constituted under section 70A in
the case of non-monetary disputes and to the Registrar, in the case of monetary disputes; and

the Arbitration Court, or the Registrar, as the case may be, shall decide such dispute and no

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




22

other court or other authority shall have jurisdiction to entertain any suit or other proceedings

in respect of such dispute.”.

40. Amendment of section 694.—In section 69A of the principal Act, in sub-section (1),

the words “dealing with banking business” shall be omitted.

41. Amendment of section 70.—In section 70 of the principal Act, in sub-section (6), after
the words “pass an award”, the words “within a period of one year in cases where monetary

matters are involved” shall be inserted.

42. Amendment of section 704.—In section 70A of the principal Act, for sub-section (2),

the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

“(2) The presiding officer of the Arbitration Court shall be an officer of and above

the rank of a Munsiff-Magistrate of the judicial service.”.
43. Amendment of section 73.—In section 73 of the principal Act,—

(1) in sub-section (2A) and its Explanation, for the words “three years”, the words

“two years” shall be substituted.

(i1) in sub-section (2A), after the Explanation, the following provisos shall be added,

namely:—

“Provided that if the winding up proceedings cannot be completed within a period
of two years from the date of appointment of liquidator under sub-section (1) of section 72, the
liquidator shall submit a report to the Government through the Registrar stating the procedural
constraints which prevent him to complete the proceedings and in such cases issue the final
order with the permission of the Government, within the time stipulated by the Government as

may be prescribed:
Provided however that such extension shall not exceed a period of one year.”.
44. Amendment of section 74C.—In section 74C of the principal Act,—
(1) the existing section shall be numbered as sub-section (1);
(i1) after sub-section (1) so numbered, the following sub-section shall be added,

namely:—

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




23

“(2) The Registrar shall suggest remedial action to Government to restructure the

activities, if necessary, based on the report of inspection.".

45. Amendment of section 76.—In section 76 of the principal Act, after the words, figures
and bracket “sub-section (2) of section 68, the words, figures and letter “or every order of the

Ombudsman, provided under section 69A, or an order” shall be inserted.
46. Amendment of section 80.—In section 80 of the principal Act,—
(1) in sub-section (3), the following sentence shall be added at the end, namely:—

“The appointment shall be regularised only after verifying his/her character and

antecedents on subsequent police verification, as may be prescribed.”.
(i1) in sub-section (3A),—

(a) after the words “servants of the societies”, the words “except the chief

executive of the societies” shall be inserted;
(b) the following sentence shall be added at the end, namely:—

“The appointment of Chief Executive of apex societies shall be made by the

Government after fixing qualifications.”.
(111) in sub-section (5),—
(a) for the words "three percent", the words “four per cent” shall be substituted;

(b) in the proviso, for the words “thirty three”, the words “twenty five” shall be
substituted.

47. Amendment of section 804.—1In section 80A of the principal Act, in sub-section (1),
after the words “of this Act”, the words “and for the employees of Co-operative Unions in the

State” shall be inserted.

48. Amendment of section 80B.—In section 80B of the principal Act, for sub-section (1),
the following shall be substituted, namely:—

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




24

“(1) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act or the rules made thereunder or
in the bye-laws of any society relating to the recruitment of officers and servants thereof, but
subject to section 80BB, the Government shall, by notification in the Gazette, constitute a
Co-operative Examination Board for the conduct of written examination for all direct
recruitment to the posts of and above the category of Junior Clerks in all co-operative societies,

Boards and other institutions under the control of the Registrar:

Provided that the Registrar may, taking into consideration the financial capacity and
viability of such society, exempt any society or class of societies from the provisions of this

sub-section, in the manner as may be prescribed.”.

49. Amendment of section 88.—In section 88 of the principal Act, for clause (e) of sub-

section (1), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—

“(e) the Assistant Director of Co-operative Audit having jurisdiction over the circle,

ex-officio;”.

50. Amendment of section 88B.—In clause (iii) of section 88B of the principal Act, after
the words ‘“an officer”, the words “or an administrator or an administrative committee
consisting of not more than three persons, one among them shall be the convenor” shall be

inserted.
51. Amendment of section 8§9.—In section 89 of the principal Act, in sub-section (4),—

(1) in clause (d), for the word, letter and bracket “clause (c)”, the word, letter and

bracket “clause (b)” shall be substituted.

(i1) in clause (e), for the word, letter and bracket “clause (d)”, the word, letter and

bracket “clause (c)” shall be substituted.

(111) in clause (f), for the word, letter and bracket “clause (e)”, the word, letter and

bracket “clause (d)” shall be substituted.

52. Amendment of section 89B.—In clause (iii) of section 89B of the principal Act, after
the words “Co-operative Department”, the words “not below the rank of Additional Registrar
or an administrator or an administrative committee consisting of three persons, one among

them shall be the Convenor” shall be inserted.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




25

53. Amendment of section 91.—In section 91 of the principal Act, in clause (c¢) of sub-
section (1), before the words “to spread”, the words “to establish educational institutions and”

shall be inserted.
54. Amendment of section 94.—In section 94 of the principal Act,—

(1) in sub-section (2), for the words “two thousand”, the words “five thousand” shall

be substituted.

(i) in sub-section (3), for the words “two thousand”, the words “five thousand” shall

be substituted.

(ii1) in sub-section (4), for the words “five thousand”, the words “ten thousand” shall

be substituted.

(iv) in sub-section (4A), for the words “five thousand”, the words “ten thousand”

shall be substituted.

(v) in sub-section (4B), for the words “one thousand”, the words “five thousand”

shall be substituted.

(vi) in sub-section (5), in clause (b), for the words “five thousand”, the words “ten

thousand” shall be substituted.

(vii) in sub-section (6), for the words “five thousand”, the words “ten thousand” shall

be substituted.

(viii) in sub-section (7), for the words “five thousand”, the words “ten thousand”

shall be substituted.

(ix) after sub-section (7), the following shall be added as sub-section (7A),

namely:—

“(7A) Any Chief Executive and the Committee of the Co-operative society who
contravenes the provisions of sub-section (3) of section 59 shall be punishable with fine which

may extend to ten thousand rupees.”.

(x) in sub-section (10), for the brackets, figures, symbols and word “(6) and (7)”, the
brackets, figures, symbol, word and letter “(6), (7) and (7A)” shall be substituted.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




26

55. Amendment of section 95.—In sub-section (4) of section 95 of the principal Act, for
the brackets, figures, symbols and word “(2), (3), (4), (5), (6) and (7)”, the brackets, figures,
symbols, word and letter “(2), (3), (4), (5), (6), (7) and (7A)” shall be substituted.

56. Insertion of new section 1064.—In the principal Act, after section 106, the following

section shall be inserted, namely: —

“106A. Power to remove difficulties.—(1) If any difficulty arises in giving effect to
the provisions of this Act, as amended by the Kerala Co-operative Societies (Amendment) Act,
2023, the State Government may, by general or special order published in the Official Gazette,
make such provisions not inconsistent with the provisions of this Act as which appear it to be

necessary or expedient for removing the difficulty:

Provided that no such order shall be made after the expiry of a period of two years from

the commencement of the Kerala Co-operative Societies (Amendment) Act, 2023.

(2) Every order made under this section shall be laid, as soon as may be after it is

made, before the Legislative Assembly.”.

57. Amendment of Schedule I—In the Schedule I of the principal Act, after serial number

15, the following serial numbers and entries shall be added, namely:—

“16. Kerala State Women Co-operative Federation Limited (VANITHAFED).
17. Kerala State Co-operative Tourism Federation Limited (TOURFED).
18. Kerala State Labour Co-operative Federation Limited (LABOURFED).

19. Kerala State Co-operative Hospital Federation Limited (HOSPITALFED).”.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




27

BHOB TVAINID

vlon (Bloamldmmoemo-ag)s]) Qldlae]

alle2emdalmo

MA@ 142/6e10Y.00)2]2/2022/mM@mo. @NJUDDaf©o0, 2024 £3)6113 7
1199 svsaio 24
1946 G£3§a%i00 17.

BH08 TLoMNIM MIVWAMVEDINS @INYL|ODIAN BVY  SaldOIBRMEBBBIOS
@nolaileed®eod]  O@IMI@  eInflebegS)emIM). WIWAAVE  ldqRILSI

(@l1s:00m88 enilgflay 2024 o@odl@d 26-00 G| VAIBERHOIOS @PMADI LIGla).

WAIBEROIOS 2OMOAIIMB (@100,

. &l. TLVM @D BN,
Mo &av50l.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




28

2024-a€e1 9-00 GG
2023-9£1 GHOS MVaN@G:06M Lol (GRRNDI) G

1969-6£1 GHO8 MVaNG:O6IN Mol BIYBHQ
aflensio LM SalgpMM@IMSs

630}
(o ¥:Ne]
aflold,.—1969-081 6H08 MVaNB:O6M TLocel BRYBY (1969-081 21-00 BVOBY)

OOIMIBUaHo &M  @RAUUDIERUWBEIX  aflezle €ERRVLGI  ©aIQRMM O

QMDD OB HIDD;

300® OlojeRles1nnd ag)$3elOTINILIN0 MVEAICTVOOBIT IO |00 (@100

MI@AMEN0H60M}:—

1. 20)B89BCa|0l (@100oEARe.—(1) WV @GN 2023-081 GHOB MVaNGO6M

mooeel (6BEMMI) @YEY ag)am) Gald alO@Do.
(2) D@ 9SMB (@I0NILIODIG QIOYMDI6M).

2. 2-00 Qidlofload 6EEOML—1969-0L1 GHO8 TVaN:OEM dLocel GBYG:HINN]

(1969-061 21-0, @YS:Q) (@IMIBUDaHO (EIWIM BYBY ag)MIEM @ l0INAUBIE66)0|S)E:)

2-00 Q) fl@d,—

() (egeni) aIEMLOBITE @6 OWIM  QAIdaldo @PAITVOM  RINOHIV

D362 |BBLOEMIDIEN), BTV OY:—

“@OAOVENBIGHUD  BHMIPSBAUGBOTIIIBS  TVaNB:O6M  TVCLIBRBIOS
SOOI,  BOAOVEMBIGBIOS  BAILINGOADA  HAVILIYaHMM)  MBEUINQB
BOMBMIBHEN0 DMBaNdERHI AIgROmIeng @AWY 6.21Q)eI0 AWIQD HONBUHMYo

OOI@ 9UdGSIM].”.

(ii) (a@V]) EUEMLOMIM] BUDHO ISP |OWIAN EUEMLO BalBBHEENIIEN),

@OV —

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




29

“lagpaudl)  “@oaddlddladesglal @Al]”  «g)MO@  avoceIoTle]
0}ofl®:06mo, MS@Blaflo MUNIIMAI0, NIONGBOSDIo BVEODENIB:BOSDIo AY
BOAUSBOSDIo  MIAHIBOT, @YERIMO MIVE@MeM  MoilwomMe  9UBe eSS
MoLIODIONG a)BJ0 @I0IEBRS0, TVaNGO6M OMIEBBUIBOMIAVOla] @RNEBRSOS
MOMIODIS  GHMo  BldOMIaOlofleeMm@la) @odlend  (EIUBEMMEdRUd
a)(@COMIBo DalE@IN(EIBRIDIOIIM] af)MBIOMFW0 TLAV}EHANO QileI]}OH@D
a)MAB@ONIB) M@ DD BogJDMBM @YWIQ  ©alB6andBamm)  @ryaslglo
8ag).ql. @IQl0 ©UBOR IS} @RDIBYIMNY;” .

(i)  (UWlag) IEMLODIM}  GUDaHo,  @IOYAODIAN  EUGMWEBRUD

B2lBBHENZMIG), BRIV D) —

“(Wlendl) “@Io0dld  &H0BaHld  QIO@ald  MVo2LIEBRUILMNBS  Hald®)]
M2aNQOAU@A” af)MO@  @OLAld  @0BaHld Q@D TLoPLIERBIeS
MORQUMB  ©9BMEIM  IAIBOMEERBlo OUBOHNIBSIAM, B0}  CHOEIDY®
03old@o |NDIEROSBS, wNLIEIGAIW SO GITVINJOAIA  STVILIYPaHMD  a)ATY

@OAOLONIHYM].

(W) “@6emeavidato”  af)MI@  ©ald®)  @YAUUDIOBIMOD
WMNAVaNIDo  LIBMIGOIMDIMBS an6eNE VIO ilaeelm@Im ealendl 80} ol
MUNJalMo DEMIBNB )N 6)ald®} DCGUDIOMIHNE @ESITAdIMOMIES, AVoMLOIM
MBE9IBIOHNG  @PoUTB:006OMINS, BafleiMAOW AVa0GO6M  MVoLIEBSIHS &0}

8Da 1210018 350D af)MBOLONIBIIMY;”.

(iv) (®agenil) eIeML@BIM] ald:0o IO EUEMDO BalBGHOENB®IEN),

@OOOIDD):—

“(@agendl)  “@aDAWO@  AVaNB:OEM  AVoLlo”  af)MMOM@ BRGSO
@IUBODM 6aIEI@ID] BMIM BHSIO@ eIV MVoMROIM  MVBHSHIGDI
QUBDIBHES0 DY MVaDBO6M MVoCLIEBRESI @PMINNG BRoWEEBRSITIFISIMNAIW SO}
MaDSO6M V0% lo )M B@OAIGIOM]. ad)MO@, MoCLIODMISL!  ABDIN®
@RoNEBRBIOS af)fffo  TVCLIODINMR HRITDo  @RNTVRUDINS DO IO D]

VO@RIMOTIT @PUWIBAIEIM aldS)8SOEY:

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




30

a)MI@, QAUBBIN® GPoUEBBNS af)sfPo MVoeNINWlapyss alaITuN
2023-6£1 8H08 MaNGO6M Mol (BRRUMI) BYE:] (106NIEIOMIE3 AUOIM@IM; MIMT

mlelnilenemo@loym VoeLIBRUBEE) NIDWE:RIBIM E];” .

(V) (8ag)ag)) QUEMLOBIMN] aldh®o MINP O GUEMWo Gal@BHLEENI®IEN),

@RIV O):—

“(Bag)ag)) “©@IONAS 3H0BaHlS QIODald MoLlo” NI, GIBaHls:
@QIUDIEBRUBBHOD BDMINIMW  B3IBaHld (@ IQIGMMMEBRUIBHSO 6leNsl BRI
@oNEBRUBAE MOIMIOBIG MVaNIWo M@ af)IM @ (@IOLNAlS: EIGHEAD (@IWIM
enilmdlmeqo @p@ISI88®0, (@IUBCMM ea6lel 80} ailegisleel, leIOVODIGEID,
il joeilglaileeln @@l aidlalmeq]s;ovlolsissmmo@ ey MABRlaS qLa0E:06m
mooeelo, MUAQYIMNY Ma0BO6M MIES, B0} HIBaHld VAN MVaOB:O6M  6NI0H;
@ROLIBIT &0} WOBleM 6NINE; a)MMNBAOAIBMMo BOOMO0 QAUIDald:8)0S@}o
@OAIOMVBIVISBIOSDIo alellud Moeee EIAUIBOmM eaaleilo OSIMISIA MU 4}

(@15:0000D]BlBeM @IR06N:

ad)MO@,  @IAUBODM  GARILIOD  MLoeNIMWlapss  dlw@memo
2000 =Myl 1-a3  mleaileenzo@lo)n  MLCCLIERUBBHND  ENINE:GUBBHED

ENIOW AR DE].”.

(vi) (a3enil) eIeMLOMIM] ald®0 IO |OWIMN EUEMWo GalBGHEENIMIEN),

@RIV —

“(@enil) “@1o10ale QI@ald Moelo” og)MIM BPGIONY BRNEBRUBLE)
&So  M@MBYMDIMe  MledHalOmIMe  BUNEl  @P@IOM  @ooweRgl@d  mlmmyo
mledHalo MVlO1E9B oM@ BRMIHG @IONAE: EIGHIGNI @IWIM enflmilmemyo
BORM @PMINNR DalMIWAGEBUD (@IBI00 MG TVANBOEM TVCLIBROS BOMION]
@oUEBRBILHIM  AVMIAUECIBHICMOINID (IRl  &0BaHlS @G  Tvoeelo

B91HHDIBS M0G0 MVoCLlo af)ANADNANIB}ANY;”.

(vii) (@) eMLODIM} ald0o @INYLOWIIN AUEMLo GalBGHHENIMIE),

@RIV —

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




31

“(@l) “@Iondld MaDGHO6M MVoLlo” af)ANIM MVMNIMEDOD GO}
oaimy Hlgjaleen amleiWls.e Hlgle:gleenanalsym, cgeomssleno allrldegudlesnsaq]s
(@1BBUDODY BPUWIBIBI® 9880 AIKBMIB:S)0, MG MVALIEBRS0, MMLAIM TVBLIO0,
MGGUD (NoBEOEM NI IMEBBBle BPGINM BVoWERIIVISIBIONAO® SO} MVoLlo

2N BOAIHIMY;”.

(viii) (adl) QUEMLODIM “a@O®O0] @YBY” ag)IM] QAUILNGUBEE] ald®o
“MoNIM  TVBESIBIOME  MEREE®IO}  DERPMAVNOMP” o)W AUIBNE:UD

GalBCHSENZMIEM).

(ix) (@yenil) aIEMLOBIM; GUDaHO MIPQJODIM GUEMUO B2l@BHLOENE®MIGN),

BRIV O):—

“(aenilag)) “auomga0y MaOH06M oL16813UB” a@)M OB
Glan 6uoatle60ad, (EIEODAIB, (SIMMIORAFOYBU, QilaHdBo 60Ul @OBYE:UD,
pommile  eaippallgleud  emalsimaid  Galoepss  auomadlss  ailleoweanses
CHHHUNOMIMY calenzl ©aile0la) @O0l MVaNBO6M MoCL16B3UY

2@)OMNBOAIHIMY;”.

%) (@@A3ag) UMLODMI@, “CLoMNIM  MVANGOEM  HIBaHlH:-(NIR6M
all&aum eni®;” o)l QAEO}BWHS] MM  “CGHO8” a)M QIS

CalBGHSENZMOM).

(xi) (@) QUEMLETIM] BUDaHO GIHP|OWIAN AUGTWo  BalBCHOENBEIGN),

BROIQO):—

“(al) “@iaIBm TVaNGHOEM MVoeLIERUB” ag)MIM B0} Hlp|BBO
(@IQUBOD Ml WI88®}0 HD®ISILIQITLOAR0 AUOIRIMA TVHIBHEB, WIQILMBHHNO
ag)M| EIGHEBREBINS MVoORBMIo, o RBI® MVIEB:MIB:ll3), MM ailaie:ud, qROAds-
@ U0 o)A G@I0ENIablo{leeym @M@l oHElgud ©21VTISS TVaOB:06M

ML2LIBRUB ag)IMBLOMIBIM.”.

3. 3-00 QlB1a {1603 GREUVM].—(EIWIM BYG:QIOLI 3-00 QI {lod,—

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




32

(i) (1)-00 2010 [@ “@O) AUGDIOW” o] AUILNGUBL]  ald 0o

“0MoMNOM MBLHIAIOMY B0} BablTVEO” ag)aM] AUIBENE:UD GaIBEHLSENZEIE).

(i) (2)-00 ©alQIB)a || “aBO@O0IUBLN” a)aM QUOSBSIM] ald:0o “TMVoMOIM

MBEIBIOTG aBO@I0} 83020lTVABEB6” ag)M] AUIBEEBUD B2lGBBOEMZDIG).

4. 7-00 QIBa {1008 BEENTI.—@IWIM BYB:GIOLI 7-00 QB {l@d,—

(i) (1)-00 9alQIds)o fl@d,—

(a@)) (W) EUEMLEBI@D “2168BUB” oM AIBSIMYo allaN@BIMo BUDaHO

QIO}M “GRAF” ag)aM QAUIBE) MIHB6)0 6)2I16QYENBMI6);

(enil) () sueMLOBI@, “EelMISIBHS) BENIDERLIRIWIT @PEZaOOMIY
@GaldH MVfla0la] BN M@ B@I6MNI0 FlAITVOMIM0 @Y MorLINe BPGION
Dalmlnensle 0HlqRd 621QIARM@IEM.” ag)M| QAUIBNEBUWBEN0  allam@rBilmyo

Al 00 “; SISO~ ag)M allaMAlo QAIIBN CalBEHHENEZMI6ENT;

() (£2) QUEMLOMIM} EUDAHO I JOWIAM EUEMWo BalBELENZMOEN),

@RIV —

“(ag)af) a@QONe B0 6300001 MEIWMAOD] MldGley  QIODald
MVLIBRUD N3] RIGHOM @RMBaI®IMIDI00 Blal TVAIOBIHAJMY AUIDEIDO

VANG06M MVoLIGERUD 63(0) BldhHo 0ol (momaﬂ@_y(mgo;

oedlni(S0B86)  BENIVERLIAODIT  @VEGaNOHIM @Gald:H  MVUfld:®la)
DRG] MQO@ @0}]I® FlaIMOBIMEGe @Y TUoeLIle @PGINN DalMWNEBRS)o

0=layd ©.21QOARM @6

a)IMI@, D  AIMWOMIOE! o@BQAIJ0 B0  Ba0d]  MILIWMo
MUoeNIMWla| QIUMIN  alSld:  LRODIB:Ud/alSld:  QIBQERUD, AOIVENIMLMo, QAIMI,
SOMBMIORMYOIB®UB,  @I0NAlE: @M MOM§B®I  HHIBGOIMe|OBH  TVaNB:O6M
MVeLIBRUY, MBI, BHHIBSED:UB, alOMIIN®  QIPAIATVID]G  TVaOB06M

(MVoCLIEBRUB a)MNIQAUDIBE) ENIOWEBDIBIM DE].”.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




33

(i) (2)-00 2alQIBY @ “a@¥ BlAUMVOBIME:0” a@)aM] QUOBNEB:UWDHO] ald:00o

“almlmer@] GlaIromIN@o” ag)am] QIDEGUD GaIBGHSENIMIE).

(i) (3)-00 DalQUB @B “©@®o6M0 GlAITVEBIM®0” «g)IM] AUOLNBUBL)]

ald0o “@R0Jal0) GlAINVODIME:0” o) QAIOHBUD BalBBHENBMIGN).

5. 8af) Q& 6EROMI.—E@IWOm G¥&Gleel 8ag) aldeflom (2)-o.

9alQldhlo{ldd “@00Jal®) dlaimvomlmysslad” ag)aml QI0HHUD
a)QI1eSEOH@IBHH@IGEMO QIO ©) @nalloseeldo “MO@q | OB ernT

Gl IM8SI@” ag)aM] AIOEBGHUB ald:0o BalBCHNHENZMIE).

6. 14-00 QId)a {1003 BV —(IWIM @OB:FIOLR! 14-00 Qld:a{lod,—

() 14-00 QIB)aflod 203M@ UBlBHUBODI@  “B:)516.2J0BNBW0” ag)m

Q1H80) BUdaHo “LID]HEGH” ag)aN QOB C2lBBHENBDI6N).
(ii) (1)-00 DalQIBo{l@d,—

(o)) “avoceiomIM),” ag)m QAIDESIMYo allaMO®IMNIo BUdaHo “ORIMI SIS
DIVSSIB8  @oUTIBHO0BOMIS;  &YSII,” a@)]  AOENIB®S  allamauio

B2lBBHENIMIE);

(enil) “@3aml@d 06Nz BGINOMINR” ag)M] AUILOIB:UBL] ald0o “GHlel”

a@)M QUIIHE) BalBBHSHENZMIGNM).

(i) (2)-00 9ol fl@d, “MUoLIBRUBGSE),” ag) QAESIMY allam@r@ImNyo
GUDaHo “EedlMISI01S MMBBHSIWIBS @UIEGI0EDMIS) BSIWY0,” ag)M| AUILEB:B)0
aflamane GalBeHeEMmEM0 “DAMI@ 63} ROWODING” ag)M] QIOBEEGUBHE)] ald:00o

“BH0ILI” ag)(M QIIHE) GalBBHSENZMIAIE).

(iv) (2)-00 9alQld)aflm} GUDaHo (2aG) ©alQlB:)a o] @6 jO@IMAI

B2lBBHENZMIEM),—

“(2ag) olenailenss negemsslee MIWAOMIGRID 21568BSIGRI0 oBO@IO}
MoLIOMIOd@Ye Dall@nengleed alloyeLMID] ag)rmmeM @SRl Moel0

@UERHMDISS TMVoLICMIONG LMO@ GENIOW] BRINOMIT BHAIRI EYOlaltdHODI @3

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




@IGD@o o DAPIOS]  BBMO  BPTIEIW®:END  TVeLIEBBWEE 0  oBOMESIE0

MLoINMO®I LIIESHIQIIM @I6EN):

a)IMI@, BREBREM@BSY LIWMo  MSe{leNEM@IM MM, (EIGao
AIOQROSBSODBHINE aBO@MO0; MVoALIARAOIWIBEMI  EIDMOMIT  oB|BSEMED® @)
(Moelo @RISR LBMOM GENIIUSI BWINDHIT BBHAIRI GOl IBHBOMINS o ldPOLSID

830} (ICAOMILNHS BROMOo LIRMNOMINT @RoUIld:000 MTIBHENB®I6M).”.

V) (3)00  Qalidofl@,  “(2)-00  alIBCaO”  a@)AM  allam@@IMN0
@OHAOOMIMo AUIBSIMIo aldh®o “(2)-00 DalQldBa]d @EERIEH@ (2ag) DalQldh)Ge]d”
ag)M 2flaMEBRS}0 BEHEBRBL0 QUIBNBSB)o GalBEHNEMEM0 “00BHNIQENI, Qileermend,
35162 B006EI0” ag)M]  AUIBNGUWEN0  allaDOBIMP  ald@o  “@SleojdLee6eId,
EIDMEAD, OOGMIQCAD GBROERBIT AlleEMEnd” ag)M] QAI0ENGSlo  allaeBnRslo

GalBBHENIDAI6I).

(Vi) (7)-00 DalQlBa{lM} BUDaHO @INS|OIAM DalQld:la] BalBEHOENE®IEN),

BROIQO):—

“(8) (1)-00 Da10IB)Ba 0 (2)-00 alQUBIGa]O @GR (22g) DalQld:)Ge]d
@000  EINIM® MVoLIERUD @QPINIBSI@MY OXINISIB  @PRoUTIGOl oA
@OMDISS8e  MIOELIOGBl0  HOGA0)MTIMS8  QllLdERI®  alRL®I®o
LIDM RO, @D  TVo®IGaldeRl,  EWIMISI0P  MVoCLIEERS)o

@Ivlelle.oleosenzmos).”.

7. 14ag)eg) QldelO) 6EBEUNMI.—EIWIM @:gleel 14ag)eg) Qld:o{ldd,—

(i) (2)-00 9alQldaflm] GUDaHo @& |O@IOM DalQldh)oidh0d

B2lBBHENZMIG), BRIV D) —

“(2ag)) @RMIENIMNW NN IMEERSEICRIDI L8 630200lMrIWM Allaolmend
MLOMIOBIS MVNIWEAI 56-00 QAUBY{IHG (2)-00 Dol @ QIO B21DDMIHSS
(@13:000 MVorRIODleNg s @PQRIGOOMI@ MIMo QleOlEeLnME™Ie  BRMIENIAW

MN2aIMEBRSICRID MBS 6300001 MILIWMo BYIHGHBB aGOMIO) MISA MICHHIOIo,

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




35

oedlmisod MIBe3UBlesM MOMBEMWERRUBES) Allelw@AI®] Muoeelo/erudesl@d mlango

QD IO @OMAUG]2J} NTBEBENBEI6).

2enl) VABBIA@ MWl AVINIEDIG MVe0Io TVflé:dla] oBO®OD}
(MVoLINI0/eNIdERle  @RMIENITWINNIIMERSIOEl  AWDOHAB  6eNIDAWIM  6H03

MB£8600le0d 6MIalNle:e8, MldeR@ILeq]s (18000, DUBER|SIBOIMENZEIG).

2al) 0=ln¥s0d, @PMIMNIMWAVNIAIMERSDS BHAIY, CORIGBINS

aI@IGUDOWMDYo BOYMEMIBeER. MIAIRDB66]S (1000, MSBOTHENEEIGN;

(2aul)) @RMIENINLANVNDAINEBRUDBE) MVeLIo/EeNINHLIT MM a@eO®SBRl}o
802001 mjeiwm  alladl®end  AVOMIODIE:  TVENIWEAD  M@BIAM@), UMW
(MVoALIo/eNIDEIION]  ald®EWIWo  aldPOEDD (@ ICADOMIHR  @PSIMOIMEDI @D

028lN5(S000S MMHB @oUTIGHIOCMISS BRYWIDIBHENZ®I6).

(2)  uocelo @P@IOMY  @PMIENITWILNIAIMEBBUWIAS  aN6NE
OGN0} @YIVDIBUD  aleMDEQSIOMIM Yo EITI@I® Vo elo/6NIdssled
©al0MBWIN0  alXPPISNM  (@ICADOTION  @PSIMNOOMOBI@, TVALNITIOY

D}0B,SI88 @PMAMIEIeS GRYIClesssmrmI6T).”.

(i) oleollepss (3)-90 2alQIBa{lM] GUDaHo @INYJODIMN  Dallldsla]

B2lBBHENBIMIG), BRIV D) —

“(4) Y adkflerl  M@WaI0eO®  AQINNGEIT o@D
@nselallogmoeo, 2023-0£1 GHOB TMVaNGO6M Lol (GRRUOI) @RG:JleOn]
(@1000ROMIEMNO ER@IMEUDHEAI WIODIO} @VMIENITWANNIAIMOBMDIo DD Adsla |
@1000 G IOl {6008 aldSIEPOD@I0 ag)MO@, 2023-081 BHOB MVaNGO6M
Moocel  (BRGRLMI)  BOBIIOM  @I0ROWIM}  O®MISIMMal  OHlIRd  H2IDD
laudomlesnm mlelallenss @pmMieNIMLINIMEERUE M)MBaloeo® (1) aym@d (3)
QUOOISS DalQldhle 861 AINNG:U6E) Al MIAeRIBOe]S (@ I8000

@OMIHY (IAUBGDMo TRSBONBEMIEM.”.

8. 14enil a1do{lom 6EELGI.—EIwom Gr:gleel 14enil Qlds e flad,—

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




36

() dleniloer (1)-00 9alQldlaflM} GUDaHo @IOYEO@IM  DalQlds)a3Ud

GalBGHENZMIGM), BOMIVD)—

“(1ag)) MVANGO6M MVCLIBRSBIAS BPOMDo o lghdslom O ile:oemoamlay
salems  ailuoBMO®  BEIIWLE OlE|odS ENITWER]S TLRRIERUD  GQI0ICBNENZMo
@O, @oUIBHIOOMIMIV], @OEEREHMIBS MVCLIERBIAS o ldDMEWIWNEERSI@D

mndq flesssnz@mmoe).

(Ienil) MVaOG:O6M  MLoLIERSBINS GPOMOo  alsHhISloO™  ©)aild:06mo
@oUBAlENM@IMIDI], TVaNB:OEM TVPLICMIONG 6)aldTNEWIWNEBRUD @U@l
6@l0RE 0l6ajods mIAenIB66e]s (©@IB:000, OHIMISIG MBEUM, TVBLHOBITY

TLdq{lesoemmas).

(1)) 0=kln(S0d, @EPEROM@IBB MVCLIBRSINS BVAJIY, CORIGSINS

aI@IBUDOWMDY BOYMEMIBER. MIBENDIBO6S (@100 MSCADENZMIET).

(1ad) @POMOo alBOslomOMIA) aleMo TVAANGIBHNM MW@,
(MaD&GO6M MVoLIEBRBLOS al@ISlomo, MIBENIBeea|S)M (1000 TVABSITIE]

D)MBHIB @OMIAD] BMESENBMI6M.”.

9. 15-00 Qidlafload 6cELOL—EIWIM cG&:Gleel 15-0. Adlefleoad (3)-0.

9alQldol0) GUDaHo ISP |OIAM Dalldla] Bal@BHENZMIEN), BRI OY.—

“(4) 14-0. QIBY{lORl AUQINLNGUBBHMIVIMAODI] B6MI  BPGIIUllE:6m0
Mo2LIGBRUY  MOQIM}  MLorLINRMOD]  AIENEMIIWD  LIMOBIG  oBSa]S
0600  MoLIOMIOMd@}o  ORIMIEESHM  0G0IM®MY @@  alldlspailsmoai]

B0}MBE)|ESEMEMYo B0} 85000 ]B0Y MIBHIWo @RIV GloyM@@IeM.”.

10. 16-00 QI&)a {1003 BEGERUWMI.—@IWIM GYG:QIOL! 16-00 Qld:a{l@d, mleilee

(1)-00  2alaiBaflOd  (ag) euemwowleeal () omowlend  dleolenss
lolomlenILmM@ee;  BUdaHo, IO LMl  GlaTmaileniTwmyo

B2lBBHENZMIGE), BRIV D) —

“(ing)) @IUBM  AVAOOEM  TVCRIEBBIOS MoV, Mmoe|CTTlernl

QDAY 2 RROTIIBOOD QU

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




37

ag)MI@, MIL|ODIe] QD]  RBOWIWIBIEMNIOUD  BREBREMNW)SS
@oWBRBINS @RoN®]o MIeIAilellpjomoB; M0 @PAIG MVoceIOmIHN] @oEmLIMVIe

@00 @YSH}ANMIAI6M.”.

11. 18-0. QIda{load 6RERWML—@EIWIM G@&:gleel 18-0. alda{leoad (3)-o.

DalQldla] @600 (@IH000 GalBBHEENZMOIET), BODIWOY:—

“(3) DY QB {l@ IO ©21DDIBBO@IIOE:, 5303 NONMI(® GBPE6E]EsI@D
@PEMIMIle@] @RoNODIONE @D6EBHM@SS QflEUDHINIB:0UD6B3B0, BVNAIB:IUDEERSI
96m0IBlE)M@I0  MoLIEBRUY M@BIAM  QAO@ald TVDGOIEBRSl0 2o |OSS
afloflw  8LAIMERUWBLS  BPBO@@INZIDIBIBHNMM  (EITVTRD  TVoCLIMDIONG
almloamnslad allmldegudleaim  @ldd0e  BVoOMIOHNG  @REBREOM@S

NIDERLIDBUBBS) allewmoDIBleaymM®IMoeM.”.

12. 19-00 QIB)a {1003 EBEROMI.—(EI1WIM @YB:QIeER! 19-00 Qld:a{lod,—

(i) mleiailenss aislajlom (1)-00 Dalldie |00 @GResMleseME®IeN;

(i) @OEI®I00 @RHSAIS (1)-00 QalidleflN] GUDaHo IO

DalQldhlo] GalBGHRENBMIE), GRMIWD).—

“(2) 80} QLECRIOTIIONG  SaDMIEWINe 6302001 MElfo  OWABOMIMD
®lo@0M )o@, B0} @RNOTIT) @PND|DWIT GISOIMSS @VAUGIUD0 630200] MJLljo
oA Ol® NO@ G QB &OeIWsAlerIDBs DeN30Iclea;M o
ad) M@, HOGQUUDMSBS 630a00lHBIOS WA MYElo BSIBOMM MODEE) A (Mo 3D}
@RoNOAM mleiolenss @PIBLOS @QIHHUDEBRUD allrleounleeoad

@pmlalcleosnsnzm)miem.”.

13. 19éenil Q1B {1608 8EENTI.—@1WOM BYB:Fleel 19enil Qi@ {ldd,—

() () eueMLOBI@ “BBAF” ag)aM AUIBE BFIAUIBLOEMEEIE.

(i) (ag)en) @UEMLODI@, “.” oM allaMO®IM] Do ; BHISOOD®” ag)am

2llamQlio QAIDHEo BalBBHENMMILN).

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




38

(i) (ag)ad) QUAMLOBIM] GUDaHO, @IHPAJODIAM EUGMWO BalBBHEENI®IEN),

@RIV —

“(=d) (@M@ MUoreIOMION] AlGlie ald@IEWINQLe @GooU3ld:@la)
®OOD@ GlEe |oBdSI6MIeSIe o a@3Qlle a @I RIQRSO! @AY Glee 0dSI@d 9Udea]s

G l0DIDDGBIHS MVo(NaNQo;”.

14. 20-00 Qidrlofload  6EEOLOI.—EIWOM @o&:gleel 20-00 Qldafldd, (o)

UEMLOYDI @D “@MOBIMS}ENM O] ag)am QI0HeIM} aldh®o
“@OORBIMS)HNMDIel)o Moo ®2IgMo@IeRo” ag)aml QIO BN HUD
GalQCHSENZMIGM).

15. 22-0. QIda{loa] GEEROML—@EIWIM G@&:Qleel 22-0. Qldafleoad (1)-o.

9alQld)o|l@d, mlelaileel glaTomlenimwmaies; GUDaHo @099 |0

laIOmlenImm EalGEHeMBMI6T), GO D).:—

“a@)m@o@mg), Olrudal enIdE; &l MAMIWIOS HSEITVAVTVIBS RO}
@0BENIM MVaOG:06M NINBIBD, B0} AUBGTIN® ERWDDIM) HOBAUUDo AUDLHINAM
alo@0QIW] 82200 MPEIWM @, MNOBIHNE BYOD: BOSLPMIAOD B2a0G] MEIWM

MEIODI60] @oerml LV®MIMAOI] MR |SICMIVIgI88MO6M.”.

16. 26-00 QIda{lo0d GEENLTL—@EIWOM @G:QIOel 26-00 Qldqfl@d, (1)-00

9alaldofloag (enil) euembLEBI@I, “0eNzy” ag)I QANESIM ald:00 “DaN” ag)IN QIOBE)

CalBGHSENZMIEM).

17. 28-00 Qo l603 EREOM].—EIWIM @BFleel 28-00 Qld:)q fl@d,—

(i) (1)-00 9alida{lo0d M0 gloIdMlenumuM @3, —

(ag)) “auoceicanglorl &:milgle:SlerIBe88” ag)aM| QI0B6E@UDSBE) ald:0o
“a@elo  @nnald  &IBaHle AUODald  LoceIEBSIORII0 Ao (IOl

MooepleEnsloeI@io &ilgleSlerIDEN88” ag)M| AIEEE:UD B2IGCHSENIIG;

(enil) “ago@®rleNo MoLIODIHAG” ag)MM] AIDBOIBUBHSE) ald:@o “GROT00

MoLIODIONZ” o)A AOBOBUB B.2IBBBHENBEIE).

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




39

(ii) (1ag) 2ol flond gloImmleninLme:ud B3$10106EME@IE).

(i) ()  2aladlfl@d, “cdlmodlone” ey AOSSIN  ald:0o

“D0}lOMQPIDI0Q10” ag)aN AUIHE) BalQBHSENBMIEM).

(iv) (1)) 9alidafla) GUDaHo @9 ]OIAM Dalidsle] GalBGHeENZM™I6N),

BRIV —

“mdlag) ©OSQIGRID 21SBRSIGEID  MLLIOMION DalMlasssgleelo
af)AMOSM  @SERII0}MIL, 60600 MLoctIOInMd@le  Bmilgle:glon  oens)
MU0 @SSl MIAMIBE3U00 aN@@B H2IYIAM GI@IDVI@ ML) AU
@OUWIB0lB000D  @BPoEERUBBHIDI]  MVoAINEMo  H2IGRYEMIRMo GPMI@ 8OO
MoIEseM®O QlRoWEMI@ MlMmie @eQIM 28ag) Qldla{le0d (1)-0o Dalaida{ldd
QlsaIn 021001588 MmO MoQIO6M alleonoml@d mlanyo

@ @Idleassmmmoism.”.

(v) (1) @um@gﬂl@m (ii)-00 OMO®IM} aldr®o @I |ODIIM  SDMo

GalBBHSENZMIGM), BOMIVD)—

“(iii) @ROMO0 0lleemo EHlMY(SIA Qilezm 20mMOAT a1j06)a S0l Tl

D@ B30} AUBGHOHIMNG0 o IBOMIWICHHENZMIEN).”.

i) (1€)  92a1d{ld)  ald®00 IO OWIMAI  BalBEBOENR®IGN),

@RIV —

“(10) B0} QUG DalNneaRsIod a) MDA
@nserlallogmoene, @ruleoomlenss w:oilgl, 803 aemles enossleed /O3
MOMOIM  MaD@O6EM  NIIBHIGRID 630} @RANIM  MVaNBO6M  NIOBIGRID BHOS
MVOMNIM B0BaH]B: (NIBIeM QllVM ENINBLIERIO B0} (IOLNATE: MVAOBOEM BIBaH]H:
wodlemailé:aum enissleern mm 22lgjo Ma0B:06M MNIdESIERID Sl qLAQflal@d
9886MO 9NMRIVIOIMEMI BOLIBIM 6303 MVABQJlM Ma0@:06M eMNIdEI@ MOEMED
BBWAIGEID @OSLIBIT  MVaNB:O6MO/MVaNBO6M MNICMERHANG, MICMXOAF, BiaHl,
MLOMIODIA  LDOMI@o, QUdeMIERSo, aleRlds adlmommy, mlmo, IAAIlG:TLMo,
allalomoes@leaildy agyMmIUXI@  9eBUSWIMSS 06eME  QIGDIG:Ud @6l

IDIDWlB:68 qvoeei®ong @milgllad @RoneER8IWI 6H0-63001Q 6.216QENRMO6T):

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




ag)(MO@3, @ (@Id»000 BHI-630al] 6.21Q6)|S BRoNENRRIAS ag)eiNo (1ag))
9alaldlofldd  alldldeguilaflgiss clomoiWl  adlWldes aljoem oenslod

@OUWIBOlH000 ldSIB8OE:

ad)MIAO(@DL], @OEIHO00  CHI-630al] 62lQea|S  BROUNEEBUIDE),
(MaDGO6M TMVLIMBISE! aBODMIO} HDOSETMS)a{IEljo BPEEROHM@ISS @OoNEBRHSN
Mel@d A0S0 96NZIDVICIBM@EPOM®  GeNIAWION  BDERPUIB

@20QIClWOVI] HBOSETMSIBEE]SIM BPBOM@ENZIDIBlEeMORME):

ag)MI0IMOLL0, B0} MaNEO6M MUoCLIOMIHL! @100 BI-630al]
©21Q0a]3 ©@0oWERUd  GeNDAIeEI  @PoERUW  dlsleodldlesymmye  (lag)
9alaldlofldd allmlde3udlaflsiss @ed: WWORANIVOS af)sfRo  GEMBHIBE

@YAUIUDIODIERIHS BVEREOMIBS @RoUNEEROS BYINIICHSENZDAIEN):

83500, gl 0o le:dls) Bl M@ EBA MOTVELIV8IlMSSI@3,
MIBBZUDLa) (1000 BB BI-630a1] 21QYIMMaldrHo TVBLHIEOI OEIMISIEND,
BOO®} Mo IGaloEl, MIBGNDIBONS (@I8:000 AIWO® EMISIMS M@BBleE:06MS
IV 92l fldd  AGMNILSIVIFBS  (@IS:000 RO MIAMIBEGUo

6).216QENMIBMI6M).”.

(Vi) (2)-090 QalQidloflN] GUDAHo, IOCAOIMAI (22g) Dallldhle [0

B2lBBHENZMIG), BRIV D) —

“(22q)  @O&GIGED algeergleeld B0} QD aIOVLIOTHIONR
almlaenisleed alloyeLmddll «am@emm @seaEldlo}Moee 80} MuorelidTlend
smilglalleorl @O0} BoMOMIMIe, @Il  al)BemN@06eMI  BIUIB:AIEEMI
af)IMI8B®  alBlNMILOI6®, ®MSA2/@I® mmleiufleoe @alem  e:odlglalleriyes)

OMOEMS) B9 |SIM BRBOMINBIVIBILOHIMDE).

flvoGle,06Mo.—0D  9alQld)a o] EBAUUIODICRIDEHIDI, QIO@ald dVooelo

a)MOM BHOS MVOMROIM MVaNGO6M 6N108; Lilalgay, @10l @0daHld QI@ald
MVoee1eBRud, VARl MVDG:OEM ENIDERIGUD, (EIIGBUTIE: TVADG:OEM  ENIDEHIBUD,
oailem enIEd)dUB, BBaHd VAN MVaOB06M ENIEBYB:UB, BPAENIAD TVaDB:O6M

6NI0ERIUB, GO MVOMUAIM MVaNB06M BIBaHlB:-(3atlem aile:avm enioes; eilalga,

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




41

@IoLNAld VAN BHIBaHIB-IAleM  QlldIVM  6NI0HS, @PAENIAB  MVANBOEM
Mo2LIeBRUWY,  BPUI®UWL0M  MoERAIBDAY  B0-630a]e0glal  emIseLQE:UD,
a)oGeoDIY  QAI@ald ALoREIERUY, (POAIEM  MVANBOEM  VoCLIEERUD, (@ IoLNAl:
a0DMVloUT MVaDGHO6M Mo2LIEERUD, BHOS MoLNIM a0DMVlolU) BaNWBOHMD of)amy

@OA@OAIHY0MY.”.

(viii)  (3)-00  Qalidlaflond  gloadlo@leniwmI@  “Baml@dBS}M@D
MoRIOBIOE” o) QUILNEB:UBHE) ald®o “@ANIT  @JSIOT  AVCLIMDIHAZEI
QUOV®EBBRBO®  O6NEIM  BISIOT  ALCLIOBIOMREI” a)]  AUILOIDUD

GalBCHSENZMIEM).

18. 28agenil Qldlafload 6EELOI.—EIWwom c@od:gleel 28agmil Qlsq{lend

(2)-00  alaido{l®, “woilgldles  aegem®ElERe  9ERPUMNOMEDI”  ag)(M]
QOONBUBH)] GUdaHo “GRORIEIM BHmIglwodd Mlaleseq]s TMuoceimmleng o)

IDIMIWIE@EWI” ag)M] AUIBNBUD B)S1E2|BBLEMRMIET).

19. 28enil c1da {1608 8EENTI.—@EI1WOM BBB:Flee 286nil Q1@ {ldd,—

(1) (1)-90 9a10IB{l@B, “MVaNB06MTVLIGERSEIGRIBE)” ag)MN QALY ald:00
“0MaDGO6M Mo2IEERSIGRIAN Jo MoNIM MaNB:06M @IeMIMICRIDIHB6 o MVAHSNUD

MVaNGO6M @EMIQMGSICRIRIE0” o) QDL D CalBCHENZDIGN).

(i) 28enil dleflomd (2)-00 Dalaidefl@d, “CVALeIBHAG  MIe)alaH§@D
OM@30lOS” o) QAVBNGUWVSBE) aldOo “TMABHIC MR Qldla] MealaH|@D

OIVE@SOlIOS” ag)M| AUILNEUD B2IBEHLNENIEIEM.

20. 29-00 Qld)e lO] EERERWMI.—(EIWIM BB:FIeel 29-00 Qld:)q fl@d,—

(i) (1)-00 9alIB)q{l@d,—

(o)) (@Vladl) UeMLODI@, “BHEMBNGBIOSDI0” af)M QDHSIM] aldh®o

“@GUl] 6210 BHeMBNGBOSW0” o) QIOBIBUD GalGBLEENEMIEN);

(eni) (M)  UEMLEBIM  aldh0o  @IOPO@YIN  GUEMDo

B2lBBHENBIMIG), BRIV D) —

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




42

“(ndlen) Mad MLOMIODIE: QIBaHo MVALICRIOE! &Gl EPoNEBRSIHSW]o
211N @9HIOOS@Y0 @RAIOIOS )S}o6NI0(NEBRBIOS0 Mo IOICRIRD O6)

BSIYPlOHDOW ag)LJ0 MNIDWIMBOBDIo MVoeNIMWlo) Qilvdosao® eillgylend aiclwemm.

ofluodle:06mo.—e0® aIIMWLOMIHNG BBDAUUDITBIGCLIDBHID] “@}S10eNId01IEERUD”

ag)MI@  BAOMINQT, BOOY, GO &)SIHUD DUdENOSWIBB  EPAIOIOS  BSld:8)0

D02 il®MOBe810;”.

(i) (2)-00 2alQidhla] @900 (@1HIV0  aldh®o GalBGCHOENBZMIGI,

@RIV —

“2) 0xlniEIBEHOD  @PEGa0o  MIG@IUTle,mM  MOQIOIUBEHSD
MaDGO6M @YY  WDORABEHHI @0DGGaNo  MICIUTIBM  NOQOOIUBBLI
aBOMI0} MoLIOleOd@o Badlglalleed ealdmeow) AlgloUlIERId a00230IEUIMS

@RAIH000MENZDIBleeM@oI6m.”.

21. 31-00 Qidlefloag 6EEROLMI—EIWIM GB&:FIeel 31-00 Ad{leond (3)-00

92l fled,  “al@oOI@  alO®B:SIeOMI”  a)M|  QAUILNUBHE  GUDaHo
“GO0NIaOIB:8IOS  OMOMMSI 88  BAIASS} M  alO®E:SIEIEMI”  ag)aM

QUOBENBUD BalBCHENBZMI6).

22. 32-00 Q) lOad 6EENMI.—(EIWOM @YB:QIeE! 32-00 Qld:a{ldd,—

(i) (1)-90 DalQIBHq{l@d,—

(ag)) (enil) UEMLEBIMN GUDaHO IH|OIAM eleMWo (6nilag)) GUEMWO

@YV BalBBHHENZMIE), BRI ®):—

“(enflag)) @OBQIOG 76-00 QB {l@D aI1OONBUTILENAN DOHONEUD

DIOEIDA NSq {lEI080M@IM88 @eNI0Wa)BQ @0 fl¥aic@O; @oee)ssl@d”;

(end) (W) auemMLOMI@, “GPAICIM &OIe8 Mmoo, @PAIA
MoeeiOMIeEl BRonadDIBleesmeamIg)” ey QI0Ee}@:UWBEe}0 allaN@TIMYo ald0o
“, @OQIB MLoCLIOMIBERI @RoUNERSIDIBICL6HENZM Y0, @AICIT B0Ie8 &emallmoow)e”
a@dM] A0Sl allaMAllo  Gal@GHOMRMP @M GlaI®Xlerumuwmmyo

ailuodleo6mo 1-90 a3¥la1oeaaeNzm0 QllVdElE:0emo I1-6e1 “11” MBe0 6.216QYNBTIAIET);

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




(o)) () eUEMWLODI@, “06NE MYSB2|WOW BDLIWIBSlerIDBs)” ag)aml
QIBNGHUWHE aldh®o “@RSJOM &0} GHNAUWIDIGLIDH6)” oM  QIOBHUD

GalBCHENIMIGM).
(ii) (4)-00 Dalud:}o fl@d,—

“MUocRIOleNd  @I@al0PAMN0  @RYQUUDRIDV] AU (@ I1HI0MNSS
adBO  MSalSld8lo  ag)SIENM@IMIe  @RUIB:00meN0DIBleeM@IeMm.”  ag)ml
QONBURBEN0  2llaMODIMIe  aldh0o  “@RoNBRBIDS  of)MBENIWBONNT 20U86)e ]S,
MCRIOIONE  @I@al0PAMNo  @YQIUDRID]  AUEOARAM  ag)Rd  MSalSlds)o
2)S}eNM DI @RUIB:000 2eMIWIGIBHIM M0, af)IMIT HMOBEVMSIENEQ]S 630}
Smlgl @M @U@0 MVIUBBlENITBISEOMIVo @VEEROMIBS BVUIEBRUD
6QI05QUGSOUD0  QllNleoUlealomd  aldSlgPom@@IeM.”  ag)]  QUILND:B}0

21laMEBRso BalBBHOEMEMIMI6N).

23. 33-00 QI o {lOg ERERWMI.—EIWIM GB:Fleel 33-00 Qld:)q {l@d,—

(i) (1)-00 9alid)aflorl (enil) eUEMLOTIES, “@GRAIG MoLIMDIeLRI @PoUEBRUY
@@Ioleosmeamlgl” o) QUIENBUBHE)  ald0o  “@OAG  TLCRIDISE
@oomengldd  mlanimololesnemo;  @RAICIG  B00Ud” ag)aM]  QIOONHUD

G21BCHHENMIMOI6).
(ii) (2)-00 Dalid:}o fl@d,—

(@) “a@oosnlelo DERPUNIONFEWI” a@)M]  QIDHNHUBHE)) BUdaHo

“@OoNEBRBIAS af)MVEOOUWONNE 2UBOLISS” o) AUIBND:UD B2IGBLENBMIE;

(enil) @690 JO@IMM QIalB:0 @VAITVOM BINOMIV] G2IBBHHENZ®IEN),

BROIQO):—

“OMOOTMS}ENNLSIM &0} Hlgl  BREISHIOMNBS  @RoND]o
MLOUW}BOIBOIMD  aldHo @D@EIBI00 GalBBOOLS BOWNEEBRUIAE  BAIISNUMIUDO
DLPOM®e HAlGl BOOMOo  @RoNDMIAMIA)  AVOWBO6Mo  M@BIMMIgjoeE;ld

@0 (13000 MOMIBM@IMIBS H006MEBRUD QUIGHDNICHHENMIDIAI6EM).”.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




24. 342Q) o) O QUS| BalBLO@.—(EIWIM BYG:QIOE! 34-00 Qldeflmy

GUDaHo MIEP O Qldhla] GalBEHHENBMIEI), BRIV D).—

“340(). HMBNBGHBINS TV)B:Hla 1o ald®) EINV06QAIDA AV[lE:GleeR)0.—(1)
a@)BJ0  MVaDOEM  MUoLIEBR8le MIANDIBee]S (1000 EIIRMaY  B6ME}o,
ORIV oHlQlo @QONIBLHMDIN)  ©ald@ND]  BoUIlB:Clee6a]SISISS
@RBOVENEloU) M@ODI@ MIB63UDlafldleanym «nd0@®I@ wenilud ag)mE] eniyee)
Sloflory Milguo  AVOWIMILOIM GOOTIT BVEOVENE  NRANGSBlo  TVINUCTRIBs

BARAONFBBlo MQINIBS) MV}BHIBHOENI®IE).

(2) 2g)fJO MVaNB:OEM MUoeLIEERElcRIVIBMS8S8 MIAPDB6e|S ald®)
6VNGOQIOIHAE MNdaIMAlo VGHI[lo DalE@OIWAI}e TVoENITUlL] EBAUDINOD

20AQMIBEZU0eaRUD, 0EMISIAB, MIBNDIBON]S (1800 aj0e]S)0ilersEmEmOe.

(3) 6N0a0QONIO}e 0B QIOMITI] NIMWEL IS TVIOGH, QTlUDJaVID),
WIQRO MVOOGHEMA0, AQ) MoNMIB:B)o aldleuoulleamM@IMOT, ML
8)5l@oceNaila] MIde@866)0]3 (@100 S EIdaNaHEM@ HSBHMIBOH@ Slo 9UdeRS

80} OSSHMIBO@ HAV@ IMI(SINYOS HIVPLIVODITD TN lleaeeNzmIeM.”.

25. 36a4) Q1) {1608 BEBEUVTI.—(EIWIM BYB:FleR! 362g) Qlda{ldd, “10 m@m@d 15

QUOO@BS Qld)a JSleel (06N3)0 2U36A|HS)” )] ECPESEEBUIBN0 AIOBEBUBHN0
ailamMeBRWBON0 ald0o “9 MO@ 15 QOO (VN3 9Udee|es) 19 myma@d 28
Qeo@IM88 (06M3)0 20360 |6)S) Qb JSIORI” og)M] GBPEOBRS  QDBNGS)o

2llaMEBBRBY0 BalBCHHENZMIE).

26. 56-00 QB {lO] BEENTI.—(EIWIM BOB:FIeLI 56-00 QUM fI@d,—

() (1)-00 Qalaidefloel (M) aIeMLODIM] GUDaHo @IOPEJOWIMM  GUEMDO

B2lBBHENZMIG), BRIV D) —

“(auf) @PQIBIOTI®N] @oerml LdMAIMo EXIMI(SIB TVEH]2[3Ga IO

8(@10a0aHEM @ af)AYBEHHID a06NEIGLIDIHE) QIBDOEOmENZ®I6M).”.

(ii) (2)-00 DalId:}efleel (i) euemuoe ailgie8e@enz@os.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




27. 56aQ) Qldlo{lom 8EENTI.—EIWIM BBB:FIee! 56ag) Qld el ®Ie$ajoIaM

laIOmlenIMLm E2lGEHeMBZMI6T), BPEOD).—

“ag)MmO@, (MoLIEBRSOS DBRUDIEIGH|EBRSINOD] ENINWEQS
@IQIBOMEBRUBIAS MNJAIO AUMIMIENUD DaleIUINBHHEMBOOMNBBITD oMo
MoLlo B ldDIEINODION (EICAOMIHN] @oslmunomom@d odlaisadlad mlary

DMBHYB @RoUIBH000 BMESENMMIEM.”.

28. 5700l aidleflomd 6cEOM.—@Iwom co&:gleel 570 aisafleer (1)-0o

9alQd}a{l@d, “MUorLIEB8IONS®Ie MEZUD AV|oROEMMNIAIMEEBEIHSDIo Alld:avm
@PEMI0IGB8)0S0 BOMCalOLNSS N0 INEBBRBIHS@Y0 @0SInom
MOVGOEMIMID” o)l QAUDBNHUBAES  ald®o  “©ald®) @YAUIUDIEERUBBNHI)o
(MVoCLIEBRBIOS@Y0 ®ERUD (N @oEOEMINIa INEERSIOSDYo alleaum
@PEMIOIGIS:SIOSDI0  BOMEIIENSS MO IMEBBBOSWIo  @RSINOIM  AVDBOS

Al &VMOINO@I0” o) QAIDHHUD GalBBHENZMI6N).

29. 5780 o) o) Qldla] BaIBHLOHTB.—(EIWIM @&Gleel 57all aldleflmg

GUDaHo OB O Qldhla] GalGEHRENBMIEI), BRIV D).—

“57D. Ma0HOEM al)NOIRVOOEM aN6Ns al@L@I.—(1) qudeeddlm), wavg
aill2emoalmo Al @RAVIWOIOEM  MVJaNaAIDe  Mlalome  B)BENILINIVE®I
(M3 TMOQIMODIIGEID BYD MVoLIEROS al}NDIRLGlo{leeM@IMII ALOMICYDB,
Ma00@o  M@BYMBIMOD]  alev@IDI@  allmldegudlesdangm  eraBem@83
@OOMOo  MINITWMSHUBEN  QAIMOBWBEO  Allew@AdD]  “aVa0H06mM
al)MOIELIVEM aNeNE MUBlo” oM Galdl@ &0} oleRL®]  0)aille:olesdammio

M3 @866)0]3 (@18:000 BGODIONG GOeMo MSEOHENZEINIEN).
(2) anenzlepioe),—

(ag) 56-00 Qdla] (1)-00 Dalaidlofloel (o) euemMLOBIGD

a1000BUBlENIM BT aNNElSa] GPMIO VOMAIMABIT B0NWIOD SO} IBI0;

(enil) :08a]d> QIO ald MVoALIGERUD EBBBIOS BPQIBIWOYHIE MY,
AUeGle  @OWUIdUWdad oWl  equenileercmaHm  ecneElend  @MIGY

WRINODI@ HQN@ICMDY; @YAUUDIRIDI] QIOIENUIUD;

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




46

() MBBHIA &0P10H,0L16838@D @oMIQUGIB2]B6001M

@REEREMDIBS aN6NE; HhISIOD®

(W) aeLoldlea QIMOGUE  (@I®I00 aN6NEIGEISS & E@IQ

©.21QRAIM AEYODIV) GIBHD}o,
Mool e8e6NEmI6M.”.

30. 59-00 QIBa{lOR BEERLDI.—EIWIM @YG:GIOL! 59-00 Qldo{ldd Mlelailenss

(2)-00 9101 {lN} BUdHO @INY O DalQld:le] GaIBGHHEMZMIET, BVGIWD).:—

“(22g)) ®0}) Mocelo, EHIMIESI3 MUV ISISSOIe (IMITD TVLIOMIHNY
2aIM@aERSIod QIO H21DMIFISSORID AUGDHIN® alOMIUW] BHSOHASIENTD
@PWIH00 aIAlWIDI@ BS0llemm @IHDOID; CGH@e @VALONBAVICI QIO IWICWI
@OMAUGIEOIM  alOSIPPOD®ISIM}.  @IMOR®  QAUQINODOS  aBODIO}
BloARINOMIMIe  ENITWER]S  MVaNOEM  qLoRIOMIONE  aflad  ag)dSmileyslano
smilglep  eosgleel 94-00 Adlaflorr (7ag) 2alQida @ (EIOla10dlajlgiss

WOlGHHD B @PBNOIDIOlHHM@MI6).”.

31. 59). 59enil oM NG Qldhle PBUD B2IBLH@.—(IWIM BOE:QIHG

59-00 Qlds)a N} BUDaHo IS O Qo ]3>0 GalBGHSEMZMIETI, BVGIWO).:—

“592). MIOMEOROS  MEIDIBENWo.—RB0)  MVaDBHOEM  TVoLICYHIY

ODSID aleM@E)|SICININ LA VORISR MEIKMIBENDODIT QIO ald @3
Al LIGHODI@ @I69@IDIGBeM Mo@IDI@B B:mlGl @PWlE:006)0 |SIOMI® &0}
DERPWNNM/DERNUNMND, AUIDald@D olO® LIGHODIGE  @PUWIB:dleam
MoV IO afledl ag)@milayslal soadlavole @mmilglailesr ©ens
@ow&Bgle Gmilgl BPWIB:008 ST &0} TVIMEO® MEIMIBEN@o  MSOMIM
@O8lo OUWVOLOSWIBS @6  BWEBRBSEERAN &0} oldMelo  MeIMIdeHo

MNSCOMENSOIE).

59enil. Mo2LIBBUY  MNDAIORWA  AUTVONHOUBD QIDEBBLAN @.—TVoL16313UD,

MLoCL16BRBIAS OMO®  a06NE  9ale@IUIla]  ALNOQIEERoWA QN OEUD
@1B2223106)EMINUY, Mden@ee6q]s @1BH00M8S, MOMNBEMLEBRUY

aloelleseemmoem.”.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




47

32. 63-00 QI {1608 RERVDI.—(EIWIM BYBGRIHG 63-00 Qld:e{l@d,—

(i) (4)-90 Dol {l@d, @AY GlaidMIENIMLM@ B} GUDaH @IHY|O@IIM

laIOmlenIMLm E2lGEHeNBZ®I6T), BPEOD).—

“a@)M@O@RL], @ORIVMIST!  OleSeMBGUd D@ ©aIQYOMD
ENIDELITNOIW MVoCLIEBBBINS BIVOMI@, (EITITR® BYAUUDOMICEIBNSS WMEIO}
BIRAOAF, CVOMIOTIS QAIBGaH BPAITVLIMa] M AOTVOBIMB0 ERYWIQA @Lndailwl

(MVOBH{G)0 | S, BODENBIEM).”.

(i) (9)-90 aladiflNle @GPl  gloddOmlenIMLMDBe  ald:®o,

®I6)90 |O@IMM DalQldhla] GalGEHHENEMIEN), GOMIWD).—

“(9) a@O®ID] MVaNG:OEM MVoLIAI MOMAIM MBHNIQ @VoUIld:®la]
afle26m2a1Mo ©.21DD@AO® oIRGB BPMIIVIGRIDV] MVaNG6M @YY WDOLA
mledleanm erwlgdnioes 0} Sldlomeesdlms @rally msolesasnzmosm.
Slalead oaile:0emane, eeism@le, AWl msommm dlol, e@owlg dleajodslend
BTV eal1Qeiload@io MmQYI0ILeELlomB@e Al agyamlal MVBLIB @PoUle:dl.)

RV D@ DUB6)e|SIEOmENZ®IEM.”.

(iii) (10)-00 9alQldle] @692 |OWJo (@IHIV0 aldh00 GalGBLOENZIEN),

BROIQO):—

“(10) )0 @OEBIY QVOALIERSIOSI0 g)fO (NIAIEM  TVaDBOEM
ENIOEHYBHBIOSDY0  WMalOMO®  HEMANGHUD Va0  BBOUIG  AWDOLKA
@ooUild0la]  alomelldd  mlamss eowlglet)  GanmE:e8e@®ME  @RAI]
02IQlEROEMmMo  MVaNIo LIl  @PEYBSM)  TUPLIBRSIOS  BOMAIlONI®
QflaH@EBRBI0 BOMENIMD BHEMEBN®Blo QUdla fMel @RHWIQANIOD &B:6Ns GRHAIQ
ealgflesoemmip @AWl  OleajodSidud  MVa0®OeM @AY AWOKABHE
madq flessenz@mnoen). IS ®® @lglad MooeLIoTsle)Td al6emeno
QUM HBEBI MVOMIHNEBI MIBIN0] MSODMIHEIMI of)HAMESILI0 B0 ICINERD
®3lGa [0 aleMIalaNOEMEA 2IWOMEMI 5SS |SOM, B@DWIY S 80} IO
Gle[0d3 @QOIBHENZM  @R@  MVaN@OEM  Mocel  ARPAWIG  AWOZABHB0

oHlM(S0800)0 GO }Od0SIBHONEMMI6M.  OHlMIESId 6MAlE30  @e)R®sl@d

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




MaDGO6M @AWY WOHEND om0} BxySIWOEEINAila)jed06M=0 630}
aflvocmo®  @EMiaHem  AilaldEeM@Be0]  Qldle] 682g) (@IS0 Olalmmow

afledleidmy 830a8lVASBS) (@ IBMB: OlBe 0BT B .)}6)@IS)BBOEBMIE.”.

(iv) (12)-00 Dalldo{l@d “@oAIAG MUocaItmInE! @PRonER8IVIdlessmenmnlg)
@Ol  MImMe” o)  QAUIBNGHUWBES ald0o  “@oowealdd  mMlme”  ag)aml

QIO UD BalBCHSENBZMIGM).

(V) (12)-00 9al01do{lN} BUdaHo MINPe |OWIM DalQldsla] Gal@GHOENZ®I6N),

@RIV —

“(122g)) B0} MVaNBOEM MLIOMIHNG BRUIGIM @SB /@O 0B
&SIO@ @WIQGElM 80} GINenewI, @reLEsed @WIgled) Gann}®:e86@I

@6e)Eslcd @WIQANI0eS SIAlEMEWI AIA@ELIO.|SIOMIMD aldSIROD@MOBIMN].”.

33. 64-00 Q1B {1608 BEENTI.—(EIWOM BYB:FIHNG 64-00 QUM {l@d,—

(i) (1)-00 9ol fl)  GUDaHo @O0 DalQldhq 30D

B2lBBHENZMIG), BRIV D) —

“(lag) &0} ©ald®} GIVINJOAEND OHIMISIB  @PoUTle:dl)
DMEREO®®BIIERe  GMaOQONIDEBOD  DalCIUlla]  BOAOVEMBBZUD  MQOINIBHNAM
MaDGO6M  MVoPLIBRSOS MDD, DBandenaH™ allguomlend @raslgle
g VietYalalolellwellle TN 2023WeI@Jlem@}o 21Ol WM@0 @ouwlglod

U6 |SIAM @6,

(1eni) somandencuad milgyormleng @aaslglee sarvd«igeI@Olad@lo
2023WHA@OlOM@Ie alBleuddWMI ISR BO®BIIERe CORIGSIOS By DInM]Io
@ORIBIM  BILNROAAlOMEDI  2NIBWSQIDAIHMPEWI  (@IAIBOMMO®IERS
SY@®o  ©0IS8l6e]30@,  @RWIQA/@DUIQANIG/GRHAG  GanMBUD (@ ITID®

BY@IDBRUD MaNBO6M @YY WDORHODIo OEIMISINO@Yo @POIWcHeENZ®IEM.

1) o=€lnisod emMdlesd,  MLaDOeM @AY WO

=m0 @0®I BySIWOBEIA1la 160630 MlQROMIENS8 &Y@IM6BRUd aLoeIMUWla]

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




49

@REMaHlENMD@INOD], @™ dLo®ICaldsel,  caloeilolemo  alledleidmd

a30a0larvalemo allaldo M@ EE6mIeMm.”.

(i) (4ag) 9alQIB)o{l@D, “80) MITVOBIME:0” o) QAUIBEBUBHE) ald:00o
“admlmedl  GlaInVERUWBEe®0” o) QAIDENIHUD  CalBEESEMBMY  “@GAId
@ooneER8VIolesemenmlg) @oQICIEd  MIMPp” oM QIOBGHUBBS)  ald0o

“@ooneaglad Mlimo @RI )M AIOHBUD BalBEHENBMAIE).

(i) (4end) Dol {l@3, “MaT AOTVOTIMNB0” o)V AUOBENE:UDBE) ald00o

“No@aloml@er®l FlaInEERUBEE:0” ag)M QIOEHIGUD BalBBHHENZMIE).
(iv) (5)-90 Daluds}ol@d,—

(o)) “@OAIQEN” o) QIISSIM} GUdaHo “BEEJEIT BRWIQARNI0eS

Slemd” ag)M] QIDEHHUD CalBEHENBIGN).

(enfl) “moel MOMVETINB0” o) QUOLNBUDBE ald@o  “ODMIGTND

GlaIEBRUBEO 0" )M QIIHGUD BalBBHENBMIGN).

(v) (5)-90 2a101da{lMBUDHO @IOPJODIM DalQldla] BalBGHOEMB®IGN),

BROIQO):—

“(52g)) @AWY o RBOBIIBE)] MVaOBO6M @AWY WDORASLS BRHAUIG
dlegods muadq fleeymalmymmndll, @AW, GRWIQdmIMes Slo, ®@eg)s:lcd
@WIQ Gaho, BOM®} MVoNMIGIIBE], @RUIGIOLRI BEMROMENGUd MIMLES
Mocelomlend moemadlot) HAlglMI@] 21@s] 6216QYENE®Ie @OAUOES MOJlSI

GO&IIMILIo QIIGEBRENBMAI6M).”.

(vi) (9)-00 Dalidhla] @IOPLODIo (@IHOV0 aldh0o  GalGBHEEMZMIG),

BRIV O):—

“9)  auoceiI®IOMG  (EIAUIBCMOBI@  og)OMDEIE0  BaldOIDVRBUD
906MM I Qldle] @00 MsaM  @RWIGIR  eaIglen]30@, @rlg
3lee od3lmd 213eElee06mls) Gald0IDWNG:B)o (GHDEHNS}®HB)0, oGOl 9O6T3E;l0d
@O® aldla0OleM@IN; Bodilgl MSalsle:ud Mfle:dlessnme®mie &6 QUG

8210}  ©aldEINOMIH] dldlouflmy @mMIoed qUl@:dly MSalsl quoenIMUlay

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




50

Alee 0383 Madlmo @AY Olee 033 QIDEEMEMIe BRMI@D (IMIT® GaldEIDABS)o
@06HeS):8)0  allodledlesnezomiem.  @Aly  dleaodslenss ag)el
Gal0OORDB:Blo  (BACHNS}®Blo  alCla0BlENM@ Ue0  HmAlgl  MSalsleud
a)S}ENAMN ) MISCOENBMY0 ag)BJo Gal000QDHB)o (HDCHNS) B0
al@la0CBNM@AIOO  of)f)0  QAUGHA @R  Hald@EINOWIH]  Alglouilad
WAl {60 6216QYENZMIEM). Sald@E@IW Alglot) MSIN ANV M@ al@lmernT
GlaIaVEEBWEHE  MVaNBO6M GRPWIQ WDOKABNe OHMISIALN0  2g)SIOD

MSalslwes Glee |0ds @orlgl G .2)10d0SIEHeENEMIE).”.

(vii) (9)-00 9alQld)a{l0) BUDAHO @IHEAODIMM Dalldle] GalBEGHSENI®I6EN),

@RIV —

“(9aq)) BN @YU, MooeeIOmIMyeEISsllsiss
MovdMayeanglemenss Ml@amsalsla:glad Ml &lanamM GlerIies) G06IE:ES8,
Ale60dWIe80 MUTle |lee6MI @loyemMIEMI LIAlajlsieensam qLa0E:06M GBUSIY
W@OKABBHHNI BPEGaNo MO BRI MSOMIMOW]  2RAMEIGSIOTI®
@oEIeMO BVElEIAMBBaldHo (INVO® Qflaite @O B6emeSISlou) BdablavudHas)
o=dlmny(S0600, @VEGGaNe @PUWIE006e|SIOMI® BYINICWI &h}SIWIGEIN il o e E:06mS
@PO®] MonMIGalosel, caloeflavleno allmleidm’ 6830a0lVBEHE0 ol aN@D

0.21gM @I Gleajods 6216QYeNZ®I6EM.”,

34. 65-00 QIBa {1003 BEERVTI.—(EIWIM BYB:FIeR! 65-00 QUM fI@d,—

(i) (1)-90 DalQIBhq{l@d,—
(ag)) (enil) alemuo BSI0I0EHEME®I6NT;

(enil) (aW]) EUEMLEOTIMN] 2100 WIS O AUETWO GalBBBENZGIEN),

@OOOIDD):—

“(ad)  auocsiomileony  emilglalleel  EdlaldHo  @RoUIEEBBIGEID,
@UOLIBIT  MLCLIOTIOLI @BYOE @PoMERSIOS MMMISLIMIT  BIOWICHE®O
@eRIBIM  ©alomEWow) AlgloUiland  @00OMBIMONIDIMO®  ag)sfo  BPoUNIEERESD,

aB@®IG6MI B3}00T, BVAIOIOS GBPEGIGHDIGMELID; B6L|8s03”;

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




51

(@) (ag)on) aUeMLODMI@, “GRUD MEAIMEWI” )] QUIBNDUDHE)

ald0o “BRYES8I CYSBLHHUD MICAIMEWI” oMM AIOHEGUD BalBCHHENBIGN).

(i) (2)-90 9alaldlafl@d, () EUEMLEBIMIEUDHO @IHPJODIAN  EUGTWo

B2lBBHENZMIG), BRIV D) —

“(aldl) ®REM]aHEMARMODI] ENIMLEQ|SEMO BPDIT DUBEISIBlEeIME®I
@@  eSl0)/CY8)®;UWBHE  BPEMaHEMOMIOHNG  allai@o  qU}alle lapee:06ns
o=lequd)  @ald@  MBEAIMEWI  6MEOIE30 AMIWO®  BMISINY  MTBEHEMMo

@PIBS/BOAIO}ES BINO BHUBBHMMNDIM SOV MTIBHHENIMIMIEN.”.

(iii) (2)-00 DalQld)aflN} BUDaHO, MISPQJO@IM DalQldsla] Bol@EHENE®MIGN),

BROIQO):—

“(220) DY Adle] @00 MSOMI®  @PEMIaHEeM  Qil2looemldd
a)OOMEIE0 Gl  HAISle|SOE, 0HIMISIBEHHI, @PEMIaHEM  Qilaldoem
MSOOM@IM  @o6Ga00  BRWIMHI06]SIOTI®  QI§BOICDI/QI§BDIBUdEH0,
QBN ENIDWI® ®136)0]S}OIM @Y 90360 |0S, MoLIOYMIMIENZ0®
Gal00ODAWOSDIo @alaNBlENB]S TIBDYo, AF MaHedBBlo MVoeNIMWla) ailuoeno®
&0} BPEM|aHEM ClEa]od3 @YINIBHHENZMILT.  BOEM]aHEMABIG3, 94-00 Qld:o{lad
Sl QoM ogeamEleRe BlQo BQISIeEISOM, G@PEMIaHEM DEBPWIVNM 6O}
MDalaH|@ 0l6a]ods @®QI0066)] E=lMISIAla) M@EH:MNMEM0 @PEMINSIg o BODIUD
80} aldGq] QllUoBEI® BPEMIUEMOTBIMIWI], BPG®} Mo IGaIdeE], Galtdeflmilemo

ailedlendm’ 20a0lnBEH9 @P® 2} ®:ISIEAONBMIMI6M.”.

(iv) (5)-00 Dalaidlofl@d, “Gr0mITVeeIeIWs0IlMm8s|@” ag)m  a0GsIaY

ald0o “MOLIMOMNBILIVSAUIMISSI@” )M QUOHE) BalBEHENBMIGN).

(V) (6)-00 Dalaid)afl@d, “32-00 Qda{lOrl  QIQINOGUBEOHMAVIGRODI]”
o) QBB BN0 BRBHOTIMIo 2llaMOBIMI0 ald:0o “GNITWEIQ]S BBHlHUBHE
QI0Bo BHUBBHIMIBS @PAINVO0 MM GUdaHo MIWAIOAIW” o) QUIBEDUD

CGalBBHSENZMOM).

(vi) (6)-00 D1l {l0Y BUDaHO, @IHEQJO@IMM Dalldle] BalBGHOENZ®IEN),

@RIV —

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




52

“(7) a@e®®lelo @OEMaH6M Qll2aldeMI@ MVaOGHO6M MVoLIOYRIE
ABOOBLI0 (HDCHNHESI al6eMIalaDOEMEAD aleMERI AUMIMIAUSGHEBI CYND]HESO
®3lea 0 ©AISIEa )0 MSOMDMICWI @PeLIBIGE VARICTIN  af)eOMERIE0  MaYo
DEMOWMICWI  ©AIS6e|30@,  0RlMVEI6H0  0RIMISIB  D®IERIDBeIW]
@100 @PUIE:0060]SIOMIWEMO  2RAOEINSJODVIVEDD BY® oGO0}
9BRPRUNIVNCMO, MaYo @ISO SIOTIOBHENET MWAMSaISIG:Slenes avocaIosleny
@0ala00l866e]s G@OeRIIM  6ISls]  aleMo,  QAUMTOIAUSBGW, YNV B:UD

aflemnzseaM@IMIQINDIAO® TVDIO MSalSIGUD ag)SIEHNMBIET).”.

35. 66-00 Qldloflo) BEENOI.—EIWIM BYB:FIeL! 66-00 Qlds)q fl@d,—

(i) (2)-00 9alQld)ofla)  BUdaHo @IS |OIM DalQldh)oid0d

B2lBBHENZMIG), BRIV D) —

“(200)) @OE]BAV, HAVMSOB, HAOAWOD MVaNG:OEM TVoCLIERBIHSW]o
DOQEJO (@IONAlS TVaNGO6M MoPLIBRSIHSD]o alBleUddWMD B, oeElMiSIBH)
@630  MRVEMeMOTIMSISIeN8s8  @2a0lTVdM0eS  (@Ele®ie  Slalem

@PW]B:006)0|S}OMIQIN @I6N).

2enl) OMOOTIENS8  oIOIGUDOWMEBIOS  OlBe oB3  ENIMLeQS
@E BTV, HAVMBSE, HaNAO@  MVoLIEBRUWEN0, af)Ld EINAlE: Va0GO6M
MorIEBRUdEe}0 Ma]® GlaITEMIMSSITd GoaIdMEI0 MTEHeNEMe @OIDle] pIEls)
ool aom@  mogjomledl  dlairvuesdei@salmssled  eslnisod  mMINed:
alemWle: Gldlo 88 M Iole:000@ 80} MSalsl Gleajods cN@@ 6.21QIM &algleeo

Moeel®1e0d aflef) agyd:milayslailmie ennwm emsoaiiclesym@mos.”.
(i) (6)-00 alQidlofio BPDIHG GloIOMleNIMWLMDY0 QllgI:8cENZ®IE.

36. 66l Qld)a 808 BREUMI.—@IWIM @YG:Qlee! 66l Qlds)q l@d,—

(i) mleiailenss aida{lom (1)-00 9alldia [0 @oES DESENEMO6T).

(i) @OEISHI00 @PESAlg (1)-00 QalQidlaflorl euemMo  (ag)af)-0m (ed])

alemLROI allMORHOo @mcs@ma@oe;m“.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




53

(iii) @OEISHIOV0 allNORHV0 oal@® (H])  alemwO®IMN  M)Balo]

I8 |O@IAN GUEMbo B2lBBHHENZMIE), BRIV D) :—

“(ag)on) Smilgl @0oUIlddly] @G Jdlegjodslemenss  @loyom@d

Gl@a 03831810 MLIOMIHNG aldMEINODIONG (@ IGA®AI0.”.

(iv) (1)-00 9alQdlaflny GUOaHo @INSODIMAI  (2)-00  DalQldla oD

GalBGHENZMIGM), BVMIVD)—

“(2) a@O®O0} MVAN@OEM VoI, MVaNEOEM MVoLIOHIONG aflad
ag)@milagslal - @wnoaillufl - moeHea S  eEull]  Eladommeanslcmenss
Oa@MOM  Olegemidud  quadeflessez®ie, @@  0=laisod  @inoailul
allMal0leuooWlesneMmemio 60600  OH@AIMo  SHFlWIEMIOYe 0=l SOad
@QIGLI®:Mo  MSOMI®  Oleg|odsleny  @rSINdmEBlad  @loem@  Olegods
MG {leME@MI6M. oGO0 MVoelo WINITVADo GlE3eMIUd MUAd, flee0ad
al0IBWE|S}MaldHo ARIMI(SIB86) MIAERDIBONLISIM (@ISHI0MBS MVoCLIBRSRIOS
®oomlolale 80QUlwyo @SlnNOMee|S;O0) al®lnoloo 010D

@RWIBO1H60000) all® 2)AOMOIM @RUW]E:00m6N30IOlLaM™I6N.”.

37. 68-00 QB {lO] BEENOI.—EIWIM BYBFIONY 68-00 Qlds)a f|@d,—

() (D-9% alaidofld®, “@PMIOg (EIAUBOMMo  @RAITVIMIq {lE6)}E:EWI
e21M@IVISDVI@” o) QAUOLND®:UWVBS  GUDaHo  “@oogiEl@d  alleleimmd

80a0l0es dleg|odslend @oSInndIMOMIGE” ag)M] QI0EENE:UD B2l@BHEENI®IEN).
(i) (3)-00 alud:o{l@d,—

(a) “mo%oJ(o"IcLoococsmo” o)  QIGSIM]  GUdaHo  “@ROIT)

AlaIne90e1001WlEaSSI T o) QIOBEGUD CalGCHENBMIGN);
(enil) ®999a oM GlaIOMIENINWLM E21BEHHENZ®IET), BVGIWD).:—

“af)NO@ @O0  HHOLIWSA], ORINISIN®S  allenlaInIUwla:000
@IB@IUIloOB:06M  AVAITVAWEBHE@  2)SIO  CORIOLIS)ODID  BIVEMTMOTS
Gl@eeila fleO00RM @0 WIO®O0} H:006MAIVDOERe  Gldeeila{la] @OrI@SQT @POIGY

GOl @pWle:dleedm aldSIgoem@IMIB3MMY.”.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




38. 68enil o) o@D QIBYe] B2IBLOT.—@IWIM BYB:QIHG 68ag) QIBa{lN]

BUdaHo @I 0@ 686nil QIB:)a] B2IGBBHENEEIET), BPMIWDY:—

“68enil.  (BHNBHOSIHUD DOEIODAI 660040 821 ®IQY

walemenadlemd  @egslad  0sln)sodee00 988 @RUI®0068308.—(1) 1860-6e!
OMWIM Wilaud Mlameadlodleern 1988-ee1 @Al mleoowm @YHFIGEI
@OLJBI@ OeNEIENRERI OB AUIMOBUB (1500 B3O} MV LIGYBISE! al6MIalaDOEMEAI
(HDCHNS)HHEBI @RIIN@IEWO MVoNIMWla] BHMVIGUB, TVBLHITIEMI OEIMI(SIBEH6)0,
BOOD®}] MoNDIGaIISE], @OEMaHEMAMIM @ISBMSalSISUdHMIDI Galoeflavlemo
alledleday @ G@oFld:0alam@  MIYENIWEHI, B@OO®]  TVoNDIGaIISE,

@O 2J}OBHISIANHOQULM @AI6).

(2) 80} quoctlOBilemy olgl @PoNERUIEHNI, DBRPUMNBHN0
M He006)6mI, @PLIBITE 0eNElMe ag)@e0eo 1988-01 @RYlam Mleoowm
BT (@IBH0MSBS B0} BHQOWIM G@PEMaHeM Qilald0em, ag)MBeAl Greg)sslad
@OEMaH6Mo  MSOOIMMIMo Qo MSalslDedesieeeilmie  @omadI

MMM DIN88 @00l 0=l Sd GIdleaan@osn).

(3) MBeed mlvandlesymm  aflad  ag)Baileyslal - @oadlaruoes
S00OMI@ @M@ M@BEHeNE  @PUIB:I0] TVBHHIB MVaNBO6M  Qldlo{leny

OIS0l ERICleaM®I6M.”.

39. 69-00 QIdeflom] BERERLMI.—EIWOM @OB:FIel 69-00 Adefload (1)-0o

9alQldho{l@d,—

() (a@)2)) UeMLEBIM} ald0o @INPOWIMN AUEMo  GalBGHLEENI®IEN),

GOV
“(ag)2)) VoI MUceLIODI®N] 80} EUSIgne ®eildd; Goee)ssl@d”.

(ii) (ag))) QUEMLOBIM} BUDaHO, TIBS O (9ag)), (H22) ag)M] EUEMWEBRUY

B2lBBHENZMIGE), BRIV D) —

“(8ag)) MVa0B06M qLoIARo 14e@)ag) Qldle] @ISIOMBS GOMIENIAW

MuNJaIMEBBBo MERI@3; @o6)LJesl@d

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




55

(0=) 14enil QIdle] @100 ©Jafld:dla) alB:oslOmOBIeR! @Po1IEEBUD
oI, @PEREMWIBE ®ALOEBRSITE  aleMAVoENIMDALODm  OBHLHEBRBIOS
Mo@NDI@  70ag) QU fld SISl 0jailoy@mno@  TVa0B:0em  @deNIleSHd
BHHISOIBN aleMAVEENINWNIR MALHBRSEI@ OMNI(SIBHN0 0B ©2ICQYENBMIo,
@RBMIESHM BHISMIEWI OBWIMT(SIENI, BRDM®] MVoNMIGIIRL], @REEREMWISS
®™BB60  MBa]IBBHMEMY0, BEIGIOMBS MALHOO®  TVoeNIMWla] oGoOMsRlel}o
QIQUa0006AI @PLOAID AQ) MSalSldé:e80 MVle:dlendm ng WIOMI] BHHISTMIBHI

@UWIBHIOMOINODIEMNI @RUWIE:00lIM@NZIDVIBIB,M DEJOCDEAISIAM].”.

40. 69ag) QIB{lOM] GREUVM.—EIWIM @BBFIOel 69ag) Qldlefleel (1)-00

9alQldho]l@d, “enIo®sloU)  EDSalISIHHUD msoOmaNn” ag)aml QOB UD

S391010GHHETRMI6N).

41. 70-00 Qido{loa 6RO —@IWOm G@&Gleel 70-00 Qidlefleel (6)-00

9alQldofl®, “80) G@PAUIAW  oldRPOCHEMEMP” o)W  QUIBEBUBHE)  GUDaHO
“aleMalONO® (IUOMEBRUS 2UBeA]S)M MVoNDIGSIM &0} QAUCHODIME:0” ag)(m]

QIO UD BalBCHSENBZMIGM).

42. 702q) Qdeflond REROML.—EIWIm G¥&Gleel 70ag) Qdaflead (2)-00

92l oI} ald:00 MIOCODIM DalQldle] GalBBSENIMIET), BRMOWTY:—

“(2) @dmilecSaHM 6HISTIWeS  (Elloacuallot) &dabloud  e33uSlauy@d
audaflmilear mymdadled aedlmiesq 0omsleed @o@Im; M@:sleern 988 680 detlavd

@@IoleLeenzmoem.”.

43. 73-00 Qld»)a 003 8RR —(EIWOM @YB:QIeE! 73-00 Qld:a{ldd,—

() 2ag) 2claidsloflene @omlang allvodle:oemomlele 988 “@3M) QIGaHo”

ag)0M] QIDBNGHUBES aldh0o “06NE QBaHo” o) QAUIBHBUD BalBCHHENZMIE).

(i) (22g) 9alidofld, ailvodle:0emOTIMN;  BUdHo IO O

laIOMININMLMBHUD @2IBCHHMNEMIEN), BRMIVD):—

“a@)IMO@, 72-00 Qlda{lo0d (1)-00 QalQidla] (@I000 Eeildfleangen

Noals] GGl O@ 0mE QAUBHSLISAUNMSSIEd  ALAIAIM  MSalSleud

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




56

a1} 50156003 SHYIQIOMaldhHo efleleawqd MSalSl(@nessud
RO BBl @M EREGOOMIOHM MSAESIOMIMN MSalsle:gler @SeERUd
aflaidlafe@oens e=lndsod meaum &0} 0lea]ods MVNd. [lEE9MEM0 EPBREHMWBS
Mo 81 @D wBemn@lee6q]sym (@1»0®0 MVBHIB wledlsflgiss
M@ IBIWDEMSSI@ VL0603 @oUIlB:00BOMIS}BS]  @RATIA  SOmEQT

al}06siaileasenzonmoem:

a)IMI@,  @IOMOD}  HOOEMAIVDIERe  @POMOo  Aldeeilofleedd  &oy

QUBaHBLIVBAT @PUWIB:O18603 aldSlgjom®oem.”.

44. 740l QIso{lo] 6EEUNGI.—(EIWIM @@:gleel 740Ul Qi) {lod,—

(i) mleiailenss ais)qflom (1)-00 2a101da o] @oesdlesenNzmI6).

(i) @OEISBI00 @RHeAlS (1)-00 QalQldlaflN}  GUDaHo @I |O@YIM

DalQldh)a] BalBGHHENZMOIEI, GOGOIWOY:—

“2)  0=8lniE0d,  aIdleuwoowmd  dlegodslend  @slmunomormld,
@QUUIEAEIE, @IAIBOMMERBUD aliMiMorlSle leanmM@IMS8 alGla0d0MSalIsle:ud

MBEeIAIeMIS MlBE3UTleBMIEMmI6T).”.

45. 76-00 QIdo O] BEERNMI.—(EIWIM @YB:QIeL! 76-00 QAda l@d, “68-00 Qldsa]

(2)-00 DalQidla], @IB:006MI” o)W QAUIBNG:UWDBN0 @PBNEBBUIBN0 ENIIBOFIMI0
BUDaHo “69ag) QUM QIO H2IQRID E300NIBAWMINIOG oBOGIV) DMDHOGD”

ag)OM| QIO HB)o BRENEBRBLo BVGHHONI0 Cal@BHENBTIIEM).

46. 80-00 Qld)a 003 BEGEBUOMI.—(@IWOM @YB:QIeE! 80-00 QId:a{ldd,—

(i) (3)-00 20l J@@ @PATIM BINVOMOIDI]  @INJODIAN QB0

B2lBBHENZMIG), BRIV D) —

“mioy® mloamoe MlAeRDeeq]s @Ie000 ollmisiss  Galoellmy
aloleuoowm@leRes @ERaNOMIOY/@OAUOIDS VJEIQINIe a3 210l@Q0

al@16UDOWla| BUDaHo MO(@EA MIWAMo (BN |SIOMAUM o l0S)88).”.

(ii) (3ag)) DalIds}ofl@d,—

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




57

(cg)) “avocelo  HlAIMBHIVOSWP”  af)M]  QAUIBNGHUWHBE  aldh®o
“TMoee1688es aflall ag)@:aVla:yslal a8¢led@iss Tuorelo &lAIMEOI0}OSW0” ag)ml

QOO UD BalBBHSENBMIG);

(eni)  ©®I69o |0 QG e @RAITVIM BGINOMIWV] G2lBBHHENI®I6N),

BRIV —

“@e o Muocainglorl  oflad  ag)Eaileyslailond  dleamo

BRIV BUB MURIDI] 21006 MVBHHIB MSEOHENIDIEM).”.
(iii) (5)-00 Qaluds}ol@d,—

(@) “@m¥aM} COMBOMO” 2G| QAUOIBNGHUBHE) aldh®o “MILl YDMMIMo”

a@)M] QOB D G2lBCHHENZMI6NY;

(enil)  gloiodleninwm@I@, “ajojor@mmMI@” agam ARSIV aldoo

“eD 0 IO @ErIl@” ag)aM QUOHE) C2lBCHHENZIE).

47. 80ag) Qdaflond 6RERVWML.—@EIWIm G&Gleel 80ag) Qdaflead (1)-00

9alQldlofl@d,  “senpdwidSlorl  ZKlaIMedId8e” o) QIBOIDHUDBE)
ald0o  “GeNIOBAGSIHRIIo  MVoMLNIMOMIL]  MVaNGHO6M  @ieMIMIG:Sleel

2N 660" ag)M] QAUIBENGHUD GalBCHSENIMIL).

48. 80enil aid)flom 6EEVLML.—@iwom G&:gloel 80enil Alde{ldd, (1)-00

92101}l ald:00 @I |ODIMAI G2IGBHSENZMILT), BOMOWD):—

“(1) 2665WMNEODI0 HAIMEHIHOWIo GlE@H3 ©.21QRINOAODI] MNITWE]S,
DY EYSJleen APV  2m0elOlsIss  algerglern  a@omeslello
MoelOMInNg  DalMlAEBEIEED o)A@ @SBRI,  og)aMOWI,
80enilenil alw:)a{la) allew@mo@ie MBEHIB VALY alle2armdalmo QIS, ag)RIO MVaNB:OEM
mooeplengleno  GeNI0dWIGSleRe  oelmisodleny  dlo@memomiad  slslenss ag
M0daIM6BBgleRIDIE0, 2MWIWA BB @OMIM} md:glee alleowesmglenmss
OO B:BSlerIDeam88 EMNOISIBS g)£)0 VIAMEEBUIENe AN ag)L;OMalB]eH

MSOMM@INODI] BB} MVaNB06M aldld::0 eNIIBW 0}aflldeclessemrsmosny:

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




58

a)MO@,  OWINFSOlT), HOMOo  MV2LIERSIHS  TVOINIODIS  GUdaHI)o
@IQIBODNGHHADD]o HEMHSIOLISIOD oGODEHILI0 TVoCLIHDMEDI Mo LIBRSBIAS
allcoweomeo MIBEP@IE66e|SIAM (@16:000 DD Dalld:a 608 asaImun@l@d alango

&39101086001M ®o6M).”.

49. 88-00 Qldaflod 6EEROLMI.—EIWOIM BBFIeORl 88-00 Qldlofloel (1)-00

9alQldo{lo] (D) IEMLOBIMN] ald0o @I JOWIAN EUEMTWo  BalBBBSETZMIL,

@RIV —

“(0) MBeSISID  BPWIBIBm@IB8  MVaNB:06M @AWY @pmilguag

WDOERA, ag)dTV BallGaH(0;”.

50. 88enil aidoflo] 6RERVLM.—@EIWIMm GBGleer 88mil alsajleel (iii)-0o

QUEMLODI@, “B0) @CITVSD” o) AUIBNGUVH] GUdHo “BROLIBIT &0}
@oalmlmiesgen Gregel@d MMl &HoWOC  GRoMR88 &8O}
@pualmlavesglal @milglo, @@l 800ud demdallmd @oalclesssmmo” ag)yam]

QUOENBUD BalBCHENBMI6N).

51. 89-00 Qldafload 6ERLOI.—EIWIM @&:Qleel 89-0o Qlda{loel (4)-0o

9alQldhofl@d,—

(i) () auemLEMI@3, “(AJ]) EUEMW(EIB000” ag)M QAUIBHIMIo BRGHHODOHIMN0
EOBGIMo ald®o “(enil) EUEMD(EIGIV0” oM QOB BOGHOU (BNUOBOQ0

CalBGHSENZMIM).

(i) (20) euemMLEMI@, “(AWl) BUIEMD(E1GIDO” )M QADBSIMIo BRGHHOOMIMIo
ENDBOQIMYo ald®o “(MJ]) EUMW(EIBHI00” af)MN QUOSN}o BOGHOUo (NIOLHQI0

B2lBBHENMIMIEM).

(iii) (cg)an) eUeMLOWI@, “(D) GUEMDEIIVO” oMM  QAOBSIMo
BOBHHOOMIMIo ENIOBOFIMI0 ald0o “(AU]) EUEMDE1BIV0” ag)aM AUIBN0 BVEHON0

ENINBOQIo GalBEBETZMIEI).

52. 89enil 0Id)q {1003 GRERWDI.—@EIWIM @G:Fleel 89enil QIsa{ldd, alemuo

(iii)-@ “@0) @YaOlMVeD” oM QAUIBNGUBHE aldh®o “GRWlaHem@d 2RI SINOS

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




59

IBQDII@ B:0@IOD 80} B20l0V60 @PeEBI 80} GPAAIMIMIBERHO @eEE:ld
O @YBBUD  @PSER)M 803 Gpaalmlavesglal e.ailglow, @I eoud

&enallnd @R®IBIEHME™I0” af)aM QAUOHENGUD BalBBHENBMIL).

53. 91-00 Qld)afload 6EERLOI.—EIWIM @&:Qleel 91-00 Qldajleel (1)-0o

9alaldoflond  (U])  eUeMLOMI@,  “TMVaDBHOEMOMIEBBOSWP”  af)N  QIIBSIM}
M)Balo@]  “0flEREPIL  MN0aIMEERUd  MUNJIallee)d®@” o) QIOHEISHUD

GalBBHSENZMIEM).

54. 94-00 QId ) {lOMR BEERNGI.—(EIWIM BBB:FIeE! 94-00 Qlds)a |@d,—

(i) (2)-00 201018 {l@D, “EENMRIDI06” ag)IM AUOLSIAY ald:®o “BPQRIWID0” ag)m

QI0HE) GalBBHHENTZMIE).

(i) (3)-90 Dalaido{l@, “EMZIDVI00” ag)M QAOSSIN) ald0o “BPQIVI00”

a@)M QIIHE) BalBBHHENZMIGENM).

(iii) (4)-00 DalQldle{l@d, “BGPQYIWI0” ag)M QABSIM ald:0o “al@IMIT0o”

a@)M QIIHE) BalBBHSENZMIGENM).

(iv) (40g) 9al0IB)a{l@d, “GPQIVI00” ag)M QAOHSINY ald0o “al@lmoiloo”

20N QIDHE) BalBCHENZMIGM).

() (4enil) 92101830 {l@3, “GR@I00” ag) ADSSIY ald:0o “BPQRIVI0” ag)am

QI0H6) B2lBBHENMIMIEM).

(vi) (5)-00 2alaudlafleoel (enil) euemMLOBI@, “@OQYIVI” gy QIOLSIAY

ald00 “al®IMNOID6” ag)M QIOHE) GalBCHHENRZ®IGN).

(vii) (6)-00 9alldol@d, “GoQIWI00” ag)M QAIGSIM ald:0o “al@IMOID0o”

a@)M QIIHE) BalBBHHENZMIGNM).

(viii) (7)-00 9alQlidsafl@d, “@GoQIDI00” ag)aM AIOSSIM ald:®o “al@lmNoloo”

a@)M QUIHE) BalBBHSENZMIGM).

(ix) (7)-00 9alQld)aflN} GUDaHo @IOOIMAI (72g)) DalQid)a 0w

B2lBBHENZMIG), BRIV D) —

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




60

“(7Teg)) o@eO®IIER0 MVa0B06M MVoRIOMIONR aflal ag)Bmilayslenld
Smilgleao 59-00 Qldle] (3)-00 Dalidieflorl QIIMNGUE eloaellEe)d@InemME;ldd

aI@INODIo ot AUBHO@IBAMM aileudlett M@E;] UBldH 8OO |SOARM@IBMN}.”.

(x) 10-00 9alQid)afl@d, “(6), (7)” a)IM ENUOBOHQYBHUBEN0 BVHEEBBUIBN0
aflam@lMyo ald@o “(6), (7), (7ag)” o) ENOOOQ®Blo BPONEBRBL0 ailaMeBBS}0

@OMHOQ0 GalBBHNENBMI6M).

55. 95-00 0l floa) 6EERWMI.—@IWOM @O&:gleel 95-00 Qdleflomd (4)-0o
9alaldofl@d, “(2), (3), (4), (5), (6), (7)” a@)AM| ENUOLOQBUBBN0 BPHSEBRUBLN0
aflameanuddeie aldoo “(2), (3), (4), (5), (6), (7), (7ag)” gy ENUOLOYPB:B}0

@RENENRSL0 2llaMEBBRS0 BPGHOQL0 CalBCHOETIMIE).

56. 1062g) o) o @@ QIB:)a] 82I086)@.—(IWIM @B:gleel 106-00 Qldleflm]

GUDaHo MOS0 Qldhla] GalBEHRENBMIEN), GRMIWD).—

“106ag). 90QHAEBUY MBS0 2P BINMBS @PUIlE000.—(1) 2023-6E!

BH08 MaNGO6M Mol (BRBRNMI) BYBQ (1000 GRRNMI QOO BVEB:GIOE
QUUMNBHUD  MSe{lRNEM @I of)omsslelo  6ONIHNEBRUd  DENZIB)MaldrHo,
MoMNIM MBHSIAIY), 8DEEPUIE: VAVGIT (EIMIELEYSIBID B ldMIOWE®I
@ICDHAIWED @YW D2OMOQ] MEAIM (EITIOI® ©9QlaHA Mldeo alQan@Ia)
@OIUDIOABGINI IGMOAGINI @RI BAMOMNYIN DD @BYBQIOL! QUUIMLOBUBHE)

Qil0}ELALIOOT TOODI@ QIKIMUOGUD DEMBIBHIQUIN 6

ag)MI@D, 2023-0L1 GHOB MVaNOEM Vol (BRI @GOG (@ I1000Go
D@ ©6NE QAlBGaH $0L1001W] @PAINVIM] 2] GUDaHo BREERHMMIBS WIHDMIV} DOMONo

13060 |S10ile601008 0 10S}BSOE.

(2) Y BB SIHB 206 Si0lemmm  BOMID; DTHO0

a1}06)e|Siil2 )o@ 9SMB @S WWANVE MIMNIISS: AUDBHEENEEIGN).”.

57. 1-00 aISl®@0S 6EENOI.—EIWIM @GOG 1-00 alSle®I@3, @nmmid

15-m} GUDaHo IO  (EGAMMIO}GSB)o DUBBNOlA}®8lo B2IGBBEENE®IE),

@RIV —

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




61

“16.  GHOS MoMNIM QAUMIMI MVANB06M HaNAWEOHID

efladlgau (imlmosana).

17. 6&O8 @LOMROIM  MVaNGOEM  SPOIMo  HaNWEOHM  eilalgauy

(S1088anW)).

18. @08 @LOLROIM OMISIT  AVANB:OEM  HaNWENaHM  elldlgaul

(celenI@e)anw)).

19. G®HO8  aLOALNIM  MVANOEM  BaNIMailg@d  BaNAEOAHT

ellalgaw (Ganomailg@deanas).”.

(vodlomB223M)

©a0m ail. ag)o.,
Ml alse ] GPAWeeTN@3 6)TVE»SON.

PUBLISHED BY THE SUPERINTENDENT OF GOVERNMENT PRESSES

AT THE GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, THIRUVANANTHAPURAM, “._E.-.r‘-
ke

= Digitally signed by VEERAN T
% Date:2024.06.07 10:21:18 +05:30

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/



		2024-06-07T22:21:18+0530
	VEERAN T




